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 September 1, 2010

The Board of Commissioners of Lorain County, Ohio met this day in a regular meeting, in the J. Grant Keys Administration Building,

226 Middle Avenue, Elyria, Ohio, at 9:35 a.m. with the following members present: Commissioner Betty Blair, President, Commissioner Ted 
Kalo, Vice-President and Commissioner Lori Kokoski, Member and Theresa L. Upton, Clerk.










JOURNAL ENTRY


Commissioners said the Pledge of Allegiance.


Commissioner Blair presented a female lab mix found on Morgan Court, LaGrange Village and will be available 9/4 at 3 pm in cage 11                 

Commissioner Blair had a thought for the day;  “kind words can be short and easy to speak but are truly endless”

The following business was transacted


__________________









JOURNAL ENTRY


Commissioner Blair presented Don Romancik, Director – Lorain County Community Development Department. Mr. Romancik thanked the Board for this opportunity.




__________________

A.







GIVEAWAYS

9:30 a.m.
Commissioner Blair drew the name of Carol Marksbury, Monroeville, Ohio who won the recycled bench that was given away at the Lorain County Fair through Lorain County Solid Waste Management District.









___________________

B.1







RESOLUTION NO. 10-607


APPROVING LORAIN COUNTY JOB AND FAMILY SERVICES BILLS FOR PAYMENT


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby approve the following Lorain County Job and 

Family Services Bills for payment, which have been signed by two or more Commissioners:

SCHEDULE


VOUCHER #



DESCRIPTION


AMOUNT

H10-1368







Health insurance


$
189,235.26

H10-1392







In county travel



$
53.00
H10-1394







Telephone service


$
1,449.48

Motion by Blair, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.

Motion carried.





____________________

b.2







RESOLUTION NO. 10-608
In the matter of confirming Investments as procured by the )

Lorain County Treasurer




    )
September 1, 2010


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby confirm Investments as procured by the Lorain 

County Treasurer.
	
	DATE
	DESCRIPTION
	AMOUNT
	INTEREST EARNED  / ON
	CUSIP
	INV WITH
	ACCT #

	1
	8/23/2010
	INT PAYMENT
	$4,500.00 
	Federal Home Loan Bank, PO#10-0010
	3133XWWM7
	US BANK
	001050976260

	2
	8/25/2010
	INT PAYMENT
	$5,025.00 
	Federal National Mortgage Assn, PO#10-0011
	31398AF80
	US BANK
	001050976260

	3
	8/25/2010
	INT PAYMENT
	$1,875.00 
	Federal Home Loan Bank, PO#10-0030
	3133XYF3
	US BANK
	001050976260


Motion by Blair, seconded by Kokoski to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All

Motion carried.





____________________

a.3







RESOLUTION NO. 10-609
In the matter of authorizing various appropriations)


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize various appropriations.

$
20,000.00
to be appropriated to:
transporting and recycling farm related tires/2010 odnr amnesty grant/recycle oh

$
20,000.00
to
2240-0000-100-000-05-6200-6218

$
20,000.00
to be appropriated to:
end of yr/golden acres

$
20,000.00
to
3420-0000-100-000-05-6200-6218

$
5,000.00
to be appropriated to:
end of yr/golden acres

$
5,000.00
to
3420-0000-100-000-05-6380-0000

$
125,000.00
to be appropriated to:
amend meet additional spending/csea

$
125,000.00
to
3520-0000-260-000-06-6200-0000

$
15,000.00
to be appropriated to:
need in act/drug task force

$
15,000.00
to
3610-3610-550-000-03-7070-0000

$
75,000.00
to be appropriated to;
proj exp/sanitary eng

$
75,000.00
to
7100-arar-300-304-11-6200-6218

Motion by Blair, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





____________________

a.4







RESOLUTION NO. 10-610
In the matter of authorizing various account transfers)


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize various account transfers.

Account transfers;

$
1,000.00
from
1000-0000-400-402-02-5000-5001
various accts/dr



To
1000-0000-400-000-02-5000-5001
$
2,000.00
from
1000-0000-400-402-02-6000-0000




To
1000-0000-400-402-02-6000-6000

$
2,000.00
from
1000-0000-400-402-02-6000-0000




To
1000-0000-400-402-02-7220-0000

$
455.00

from
1000-0000-400-4040-2-6000-0000




To
1000-0000-400-404-02-7220-0000

$
600.00

from
1000-0000-400-406-02-7200-0000




To
1000-0000-400-406-02-7220-0000

$
2,000.00
from
1000-0000-400-404-02-6380-0000




To
1000-0000-400-436-02-6200-6202

$
725.00

from
1000-0000-400-446-02-6380-6381




To
1000-0000-400-436-02-6200-6202

$
47,169.04
from
1000-0000-999-000-01-9900-9900
reimburse vac & sick lee payout for gail brunetto, john reiber & 




To
1000-0000-550-000-03-5000-5001
Richard resendez/sheriff
$
65,000.00
from
2260-0000-100-000-05-6200-6234
reminder of yr/solid waste




To
2260-0000-100-000-05-5000-5001

$
5,000.00
from
2260-0000-100-000-05-5080-5081




To
2260-0000-100-000-05-5000-5006

$
1,500.00
from
2260-0000-100-000-05-6200-6234




To
2260-0000-100-000-05-7300-7310

$
41,500.00
from
2280-0000-260-000-06-6000-0000
amend to meet additional spending/lcdjfs




To
2280-0000-260-000-06-6200-6262

$
20,000.00
from
2280-0000-260-000-06-6200-6257




To
2280-0000-260-000-06-6200-6262

$
50.00

from
2300-0000-260-260-06-6050-0000
meet proj exp/workforce dev




To
2300-0000-260-260-06-5110-0000

$
500.00

from
2520-0000-510-000-01-5100-0000
internet serv & utilities acct/clerk of courts




To
2520-0000-510-000-01-6200-6222

$
3,000.00
from
2520-0000-510-000-01-5110-0000




To
2520-0000-510-000-01-6200-6202

$
1,000.00
from
3340-a100-600-p10-05-6000-6009
exp/mental health




To
3340-a100-600-p11-05-7070-0000

$
2,000.00
from
7200-0000-100-000-11-6380-6380
exp/transit



To
7200-0000-100-000-11-5040-0000

$
3,000.00
from
7200-0000-100-000-11-6000-0000




To
7200-0000-100-000-11-5110-0000

$
1,400.00
from
7200-0000-100-00-011-6050-6050




To
7200-0000-100-000-11-5110-0000

$
2,200.00
from
8300-0000-660-000-14-7070-7076
rev to public utilities exp and life ins exp/cbcf




To
8300-0000-660-000-14-6200-6202

$
300.00

from
8300-0000-660-000-14-5080-5080




To
8300-0000-660-000-14-5080-5081

Motion by Blair, seconded by Kokoski to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All
Motion carried.





____________________

a.5







JOURNAL ENTRY
There were no advances/repayments for this day.

____________________

a.6







RESOLUTION NO. 10-611
In the matter of authorizing the purchase of supplies and)

Services for various county departments


)
 September 1, 2010
BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize the purchase of supplies and services for various County departments.

1304-10 Auditor’s (3480) 
Appraisal and consulting for Walgreen Co.  
Allied Appraisal     
3,600.00


Lorain County Auditor’s Dept – Total ------------------------------------------
-$   3,600.00

1305-10 Board of Elections 
Postage for in-house postage machine    
 Pitney Bowes Res.   
15,000.00


Lorain County Board of Elections Dept – Total -------------------------------
---$  15,000.00

1306-10 Commissioners/BG 
BPO Sept-Dec 2010 Boots for (2) Telecomm.  
Tompkins, Paula        
150.00


Lorain County Commissioners/BG Dept – Total ---------------------------------
---$     150.00

1307-10 Dog Kennel (2220) 
Amendment to P.O. 2010000553 Medical Svc.
 Mr. Kitty, Inc    
  5,000.00


Lorain County Dog Kennel Dept – Total --------------------------------------
----$   5,000.00

1308-10 Domestic Rel.(2700) 
Forensic examination and report        
 McClurg, Sherri    
  2,250.00


Lorain County Domestic Relations Dept – Total ----------------------------
------$   2,250.00

1309-10 Engineers (2580) 
Amendment to P.O. 2010001053 Postage       
Pitney Bowes      
   1,000.00


Lorain County Engineers Dept – Total ---------------------------------------
----$   1,000.00

1310-10 Golden Acres (3420)
 Pallet- regular #24 8.5 x 11 wh. Paper 
 L.C. Treasurer     
  1,132.00


Lorain County Golden Acres Dept – Total ----------------------------------
------$   1,132.00

1311-10 Job & Family (2280) 
3 yr Maint. Agreement for Scanners      
Casnet             
 33,114.48


Lorain County Job & Family Services Dept – Total -------------------
-----------$   33,114.48

1312-10 Law Library (3110)
 Amendment to P.O. 2010000974 Law Books   
West Publishing    
 50,000.00

1313-10 Law Library (3110) 
Amendment to P.O. 2010002864 Law Books   
West Publishing    
 40,000.00


Lorain County Law Library Dept – Total -----------------------------------
-----$   90,000.00

1314-10 Maintenance
 BPO Sept-Dec 2010 Boots for (9) Maint. Workers  Tompkins, Paula   
     675.00


Lorain County Maintenance Dept – Total ------------------------------------
----$      675.00

1315-10 Office Services 
Amendment to P.O. 2010000543 SBPO Jan-Dec   International Paper
 20,000.00


Lorain County Office Services Dept- Total ------------------------------------
-$   20,000.00

1316-10 Sanitary Eng. (7100) 
Amendment to P.O. 2010002257 SBPO Svc. 
K E McCartney       
75,000.00


Lorain County Sanitary Engineers Dept – Total -------------------------------
--$   75,000.00

1317-10 Sheriff’s (3260) 
Amendment to P.O. 2010001632 for CCW       
Treasurer, State     
  114.00


Lorain County Sheriff’s Dept – Total ------------------------------------------
$      114.00

1318-10 Solid Waste (2260) 
Training at Collection Center for Proper 
RET3 Job Corp.     
  1,925.00


Lorain County Solid Waste Dept – Total -------------------------------------
---$    1,925.00

1319-10 EMA (2960)
 Family Preparedness Day                          
Radio Disney       
  5,000.00

1320-10 EMA (2960) 
Volunteer Training Day                           
LCCC                
 1,539.00


Lorain County EMA Dept – Total -------------------------------------------
----$     6,539.00

Motion by Kalo, seconded by Kokoski to adopt Resolution. Ayes: all
Motion carried.





____________________

a.7







RESOLUTION NO. 10-612
In the matter of authorizing Travel Expenses to various       )

personnel to attend meetings of interest to their departments)



BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize travel expenses to various personnel to attend meeting of interest to their departments.

Lorain County Job & Family Services 

 230-10 Plavsich, Nadine MACC 2010 Annual Meeting         Columbus, OH        9/23-24/10        311.73

 231-10 Strohsack, Matthew MACC 2010 Annual Meeting       Columbus, OH        9/23-24/10        351.73

Motion by Blair, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.
Motion carried.





____________________

a.8







RESOLUTION NO. 10-613






APPROVING BILLS FOR PAYMENT


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby approve the following bills for payment, which have been signed by two or more Commissioners:

	VENDOR
	PURPOSE
	ACCOUNT #
	AMOUNT

	General
	 
	 
	 

	Vargo Vacuum
	Repairs
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6380 0000
	$235.75 

	Joan Gottschling
	Parking Refund
	1000 0000 100 142 01 7070 7089
	$10.00 

	Kenneth Burkhard
	Parking Refund
	1000 0000 100 142 01 7070 7089
	$10.00 

	Boyd Weber
	Parking Refund
	1000 0000 100 142 01 7070 7089
	$10.00 

	Milagros Pepple
	Professional Services
	1000 0000 100 142 01 6200 6218
	$233.75 

	Cintas Corporation
	Uniform Rental
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6600 6602
	$226.30 

	Xpedx/International Paper
	Custodial Supplies
	1000 0000 100 110 01 6000 6008
	$547.90 

	
	 
	TOTAL
	$1,273.70 

	Dog Kennel
	 
	 
	 

	Douds Veterinary Hospital
	Professional Services
	2220 0000 100 000 05 6200 6218
	$100.00 

	Animal House
	Professional Services
	2220 0000 100 000 05 6200 6218
	$50.00 

	Murray Ridge Animal Clinic
	Professional Services
	2220 0000 100 000 05 6200 6218
	$100.00 

	Swift First Aid
	Supplies
	2220 0000 100 000 05 6000 0000
	$44.85 

	Lorain County Agricultural Society
	Fair Tickets
	2220 0000 100 000 05 7070 0000
	$60.00 

	Forever Friends Pet Hospital, Inc
	Professional Services
	2220 0000 100 000 05 6200 6218
	$50.00 

	Fox Veterinary Hospital
	Professional Services
	2220 0000 100 000 05 6200 6218
	$50.00 

	Pneudart, inc
	Supplies
	2220 0000 100 000 05 6000 0000
	$83.68 

	
	 
	TOTAL
	$538.53 

	Bascule Bridge
	 
	 
	

	Life Safety Technologies Special Systems
	Repairs
	2640 0000 100 000 04 6380 0000
	$45.00 

	
	 
	TOTAL
	$45.00 

	Law Library
	 
	 
	

	MT Business Technologies
	Copier
	3110 0000 650 000 02 6200 0000
	$38.32 

	KCS Systems, Inc
	Professional Services
	3110 0000 650 000 02 6200 6218
	$75.00 

	Whitehouse Artesian Springs
	Water
	3110 0000 650 000 02 6000 0000
	$12.00 

	William S. Hein & Co
	Law Books
	3110 0000 650 000 02 6000 6011
	$94.51 

	
	 
	TOTAL
	$219.83 

	9-1-1 Agency 
	 
	 
	

	Whitehouse Artesian Springs
	Water
	3480 0000 100 000 03 6000 0000
	$27.00 

	Lorain County Township Association
	2010 Twsp. Directory Ad
	3480 0000 100 000 03 7220 0000
	$200.00 

	Ohio Secure Shred LLC
	Professional Services
	3480 0000 100 000 03 6200 6218
	$27.50 

	Lorain County Adult Probation
	Professional Services
	3480 0000 100 000 03 6200 6218
	$75.00 

	
	 
	TOTAL
	$329.50 

	Sanitary Engineers
	 
	 
	

	Lorain County Engineers
	Fuel
	7100 7100 300 304 11 6000 6000
	$1,087.08 

	Lorain County Engineers
	Vehicle Expenses
	7100 7100 300 304 11 6380 6380
	$311.98 

	
	 
	TOTAL
	$1,399.06 

	Airport
	 
	 
	

	Ohio Edison
	Utility Services
	7300 0000 100 000 11 6200 6202
	$124.55 

	
	 
	TOTAL
	$124.55 

	Children And Family Council
	 
	 
	

	Cynthia Spillman
	Supplies
	8100 FY11 100 000 14 6000 0000
	$15.70 

	Cynthia Spillman
	Other Expenses
	8100 FY11 100 000 14 7070 0000
	$24.43 

	
	 
	TOTAL
	$40.13 

	Golden Acres
	 
	 
	 

	CenturyLink
	Telephone Services
	3420 0000 100 000 05 6200 6202
	$497.92 

	CenturyLink
	Internet Services
	3420 0000 100 000 05 6200 6222
	$66.43 

	Ohio Secure Shred 
	Professional Services
	3420 0000 100 000 05 6200 6218
	$48.50 

	Terminix
	Pest Control
	3420 0000 100 000 05 6200 6218
	$75.00 

	Kelly Carrero
	MDS Consultant
	3420 0000 100 000 05 6200 6203
	$799.00 

	Commercial Parts & Service
	Heat Element & Switch
	3420 0000 100 000 05 6050 0000
	$142.08 

	Lorain County Engineers
	Fuel
	3420 0000 100 000 05 6000 6000
	$271.63 

	Victor Cronelius, Inc
	Dissolvable Labels
	3420 0000 100 000 05 6000 0000
	$116.45 

	Sysco Food Service
	Supplies
	3420 0000 100 000 05 6000 0000
	$221.18 

	Med Pass
	Forms
	3420 0000 100 000 05 6000 0000
	$12.00 

	Linda Lobertini
	Refund
	3420 0000 100 000 05 7070 7089
	$171.00 

	Ohio Department of Aging
	Ohio Long Term Care Guide
	3420 0000 100 000 05 7070 0000
	$400.00 

	PlumbMaster, inc
	Sink Faucet
	3420 0000 100 000 05 6380 0000
	$134.95 

	Bonnie Brunner
	Entertainment
	3420 0000 100 000 05 6200 6218
	$25.00 

	IVANS
	Medicare Billing
	3420 0000 100 000 05 6200 6218
	$17.68 

	Lifecare Ambulance
	Transport Services
	3420 0000 100 000 05 6200 6220
	$120.32 

	McKesson
	Medical Supplies
	3420 0000 100 000 05 6000 6004
	$542.55 

	
	 
	TOTAL
	$3,661.69 

	Hospitalization
	
	
	

	Fort Dearborn Life
	CITY Dep. Supp.
	1030 0000 100 000 01 5080 5086
	$340.41 

	Fort Dearborn Life
	Monthly Invoice
	1030 0000 100 000 01 5080 5086
	$17,547.75 

	Medical Mutual of Ohio 
	Claims
	7000 7000 100 000 12 5080 5084
	$205,040.08 

	Medical Mutual of Ohio 
	Claims
	2200 0000 550 000 03 6200 6228
	$16,781.34 

	Delta Dental
	Claims
	7000 7000 100 000 12 5080 5084
	$18,836.60 

	Delta Dental
	Monthly Admin. Fee
	7000 7000 100 000 12 5080 5085
	$7,960.50 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$266,506.68 


	Sanitary engineer
	
	
	

	City of north Ridgeville French creek wwp
	Lab services
	7100-7100-300-304-11-6200-6210
	$1,024.00

	
	
	total
	$1,024.00


Motion by Blair, seconded by Kokoski to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.

Motion carried.





____________________









COMMISSIONERS


b.9











Mr. Cordes requested an executive session to discuss personnel new hires at Golden Acres and ongoing labor negotiations.








________________
B.10







RESOLUTION NO. 10-614

In the matter of Supporting Issue 17 – Lorain County )

Community College 1.8 mill (1.5 replacement and .3  )

September 1, 2010

addition) levy to continue the “education and job        )

preparation programs and services of the college”       )


WHEREAS, Lorain County Community College has served Lorain County in so may ways since its founding in 1963 as Ohio’s first community college with a permanent campus. Lorain County residents spearheaded the drive to be among the first in the state to bring convenience, affordable higher education to our community by gaining voter approval for local funding; and

WHEREAS, Since that time, more than 300,000 Lorain Countians from every community have attended the college. Working partnership with our community, this college has been able to impact the economy, workforce development, and ultimately Lorain County’s qualify of life; and
WHEREAS, Issue 17 is an operating 10 year levy of 1.8 mill (1.5 mill replacement and a .3 mill addition) that will be on the November 2, 2010 ballot. This equates to $1.44 more per month for a $100,000 home; and

WHEREAS, LCCC's current 1.5 mill levy has experienced a 22% reduction value since its passage in 2001 and this combined with the 30% decrease in state funding per student has created tremendous challenges for LCCC to remain strong and respond to the community’s needs; and

WHEREAS, the demand for LCCC has grown. The 2010 fall enrollment has a new record of 13,300 students enrolled at the associate degree level and another 3,000 at University Partnership.  Since the last levy 10 years ago, LCCC's enrollment has grown 135% and given the mission of LCCC and the need for education in this economy, LCCC cannot turn students away; and

WHEREAS, LCCC has consistently cut and controlled costs including $5 million in belt tightening strategies during the past year.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, we the Lorain County Board of Commissioners support Issue 17 – Lorain County Community College 1.8 million levy to continue the “education and job preparation programs and services of the college” and to keep Lorain 
County’s best educational value strong and to ensure that LCCC is the best hope for the future.

Motion by Blair, seconded by Kokoski to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.

Motion carried.





____________________(discussion was held on the above)








TRANSIT

B.11







RESOLUTION NO. 10-615

In the matter of awarding a contract to Sona
)

Construction LLC, Independence in amount of    )

$676,000 for the Lorain County Transportation    )

Center; Phase 4 project



)


September 1, 2010


WHEREAS, bids were received and opened on Friday, August 12, 2010 for the Lorain County Transportation Center, Phase 4 Project as follows:

	Bidder
	Alt. G-1 (concrete)
	G-1 Unit price
	General 
	Electrical
	Combined

	Gene Resar
	$52,250.00
	38.00
	405,176.00
	
	598,400.00

	South Shore Electric
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	185,500.00
	No bid

	Mr. Excavator
	122,000.00
	29.50
	417,000.00
	No bid
	No bid

	Dan Ray Construction
	50,558.00
	37.00
	533,140.00
	No bid
	No bid

	Precision Engineering
	47,000.00
	15.00
	405,794.00
	No bid
	No bid

	Bay Mechanical
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	141,300.00
	No bid

	Zenith Systems
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	189,800.00
	No bid

	Sona Construction
	45,000.00
	38.00
	403,000.00
	184,000.00
	583,000.00

	Schirmer Construction
	39,830.00
	39.50
	425,620.00
	201,745.00
	608,450.00

	Jim’s Electric
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	182,200.00
	No bid

	Firelands Electric
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	186,800.00
	No bid



WHEREAS, Bay Mechanical, by letter dated August 13, 2010, withdrew their bid due to a discovered clerical error.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we do and hereby award a contract to Sona Construction LLC, Independence, Ohio in the amount of 676,000.00 for their combination bid for the Lorain County Transportation Center, Phase 4 project.  This amount represents the combination bid amount, alternate G-1 and contingency allowances.  Funds are available from account #5000 5010 100 000 10 6100 6104 (construction).  


BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that we do and hereby issue a Notice to Proceed effective on or before September 7, 2010 and to complete said contract on or before November 15, 2010.  


FURTHER BE IT RESOLVED, the County Administrator is hereby granted the authority to notify the County Auditor to release retainage at the completion of the contract.

Said bid was the lowest and most responsive bid received complying with specifications.

Motion by Blair, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.

Motion carried.





____________________









DOMESTIC RELATIONS

B.12







RESOLUTION NO. 10-616

In the matter of approving the Lorain County         )
Domestic Relations Court seeking funding in the   )
amount of $10,200 from the Department Of           )

September 1, 2010
Education’s National School Lunch Program         )
Equipment Assistance Grant


   )

BE IT RESOLVED, the Lorain County Domestic Relations Court Juvenile Division requests approval of the Lorain County Commissioners to seek funding from the Ohio Department of Education’s National School Lunch Program Equipment Assistance Grant for the purchase of new kitchen equipment.  The new equipment will allow the Central Kitchen to replace old and broken equipment in order to continue providing the residents of the Lorain County Detention Home, Pathways Group Home, Stepping Stones Residential Facility and Turning Point Shelter with quality meals in an energy efficient, safe and reliable manner.

FURTHER BE IT RESOLVED, there is no cash match required of the Lorain County General Fund.

Motion by Blair, seconded by Kokoski to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.

Motion carried.





____________________









MENTAL HEALTH

B.13







RESOLUTION NO. 10-617

In the matter of calling for the Governor and Ohio )

General Assembly to adequately fund Behavioral   )

September 1, 2010

Health Services to ensure access for All Ohioans in)

need of alcohol, drug addiction and mental health   )

services





    )

WHEREAS, the members of the Lorain County Board of Mental Health are committed to assuring that residents of Lorain County live a healthier life through access to quality mental health, alcohol and other drug prevention, treatment and supported services; and
WHERAS, two out of every three Ohioans are impacted by a  friend and/or family member with a mental illness and/or substance abuse problem; and
WHEREAS, State General Revenue Funds for community based mental health and substance abuse services in Ohio were cut disproportionally in the last biennial budget and;
WHEREAS, Ohio must address the fact that an increasing number of county boards cannot meet the Medicaid match for behavioral health services within the existing Medicaid population; and
WHEREA, fewer and fewer non-Medicaid eligible individuals with a mental illness and/or addiction have access to behavioral health services due to the continued erosion of the behavioral health safety net; and

WHEREAS, the critical condition of community alcohol, drug addition and mental health services has become so pervasive and acute that vulnerable Ohioans are suffering and dying needlessly.
NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, Behavioral Health Care IS Health are. We are resolute that the Community Behavioral Health Medicaid Match shall be funded out of the ODJFS 525 line, Boards shall not be required to utilize local levy funds to match Medicaid, and that both the ODMH line items 408 and 505, as well as the ODADAS line item 401 shall remain fully funded, with the dollars being allocated to communities.
BE IT FURTHER ESOLVED, we the Lorain County Board of Commissioners call on Governor Ted Strickland and the Ohio General Assembly to adequately fund Behavioral Health Services to ensure access for All Ohioans in need of alcohol, drug addiction and mental health   

Services.

FURTHER BE IT RESOLVED, the line items shall remain fully funded with the dollars being allocated to Lorain County for our residents to receive the proper care they deserve.
Motion by Blair, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.

Motion carried.





____________________(discussion was held on the above)

b.







COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR

Mr. James R. Cordes said it has not been long that Ron Twining has been gone (his last day was yesterday) but he is being missed already.







_______________________

c.







ASSISTANT COUNTY PROSECUTOR

Mr. Gerald A. Innes requested an executive session regarding 2 pending litigation issues.








___________________

d.







COMMISSIONERS REPORT


Commissioner Kokoski said Labor Fest is this weekend, hope to see everyone there.

Commissioner Kalo said the Fair went well, record numbers and he submitted his check for his lamb. Also spoke with several people on the $1.50 charge for storm water management.


Commissioner Blair thanked Elizabeth Rumics and Shirley R. Johnson, Oberlin and the many others that were involved with Women’s Equality Day and thanked them for the recognition of her public service and the new red hat.  Also today would have been her 52nd wedding anniversary but Chuck left last year for green pastures.

____________________(discussion was held on the above)
e.







CLERK’S REPORT




Clerk Upton had no issues for this day.


________________________
f







BOARD CORRESPONDENCE



Motion by Blair seconded by Kalo to approve the Board Correspondence and waive the reading of the same.  Ayes: All
Motion carried.

#1.
OHEPA public notice of isolated wetland application level 2 for Midview Schools, Grafton to build a new middle school impacting 0.3 acres of category 1 non-forested wetlands. August 25 copies of application may be inspected at OHEPA-DSW, Lazarus Government Center 50 W. Town St., Suite 700, Columbus, Ohio by first calling 614-644-2001

#2.
Commissioner Blair executed Family & Children Fist Council Service Coordination Mechanism re-submission 

#3.
US Senator Voinovich thanked the Board on S.2982  - the International Violence Against Women act of 2010 which Senator Kerry introduced on 2/4 and this would create a coordinator at the Department of State who would work to develop US strategies to counter violence against women, and develop emergency measures. This S.2982 is currently pending in committee on Foreign Relations, of which he is not a member but if it comes before full senate, he will be sure to keep the county’s views in mind.

#4.
RBC Capital Markets report in partnership with Economist Intelligence Unit, The New “Normal-Implications of Sovereign Debt and the Completion for Capital”

#5.
Grand Jury Report – Judge Ewers

#6.
Ohio Dept of Dev grant close out B-F-07-1BQ-1 (cc;LCCDD)

#7.
Publications: “County Chamber News briefs-July/August”; “hivelocity”; “CCAO #32”, “CCAO Statehouse reports”; “poetic justice”; “The Govdealer”; “Ohio Contractor”; “Poetic Justice”; “Legal Aid Society”; “Building Ohio”; “

#8.
Ms. Dunham-Widman complaint against caseworker (cc: LCDJFS)

#9.
Lorain County Engineer issued highway use permit #10-021 to Frontier, Marion to bore under Baumhart Rd from west side of road to east side at 580’+- north of SR 511 to service house #13501, Henrietta Twp

#10.
Sheriff in compliance with ORC 311.20 submitted July 2010 monthly report of actual cost of keeping and feeding prisoners and other person placed in charge was 37,446 meals served at cost of $1.1180-$1.1145









_______________________

g.







PUBLIC COMMENT 






(Please limit your comments to three minutes)


Shirley R. Johnson, Oberlin referred to Domestic Relations issue on agenda and said it probably should read in the last sentence reliable manager not manger and Clerk said actually it should said manner.








___________________________








JOURNAL ENTRY







Commissioner Blair moved, seconded by Kalo at 9:46 a.m. to go into an Executive Session to update contract negotiations, new hires at Golden Acres and pending litigation issues.  Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.


Motion carried.


Commissioners reconvened and the following resolutions were adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 10-618
In the matter of approving, as lead agency,
)
Sub-recipient Huron County to decrease 

)


Allocation by $138,975 and Sub-recipient, 
)

City of Norwalk to increase allocation by 
)

September 1, 2010

$138,975 of Region #4 Neighborhood 

)

Stabilization Program Funds


)

WHEREAS, Lorain County, Ohio has been designated as the lead community responsible for administering the grant provided from the State of Ohio Department of Development to implement project activities identified in the Region 4 Neighborhood Stabilization Program (NSP), as a result of the enactment of Title III of Division B of the Housing and Economic Recovery Act of 2008 (HERA); and

WHEREAS, Region 4 includes the City of North Ridgeville, the City of Norwalk, Huron County, and Lorain County, Ohio; and

WHEREAS, Huron County and the City of Norwalk entered into sub-recipient agreements with Lorain County in the amount of $435,000 each; and

WHEREAS, Huron County has requested a decrease of $138,975.00, thereby decreasing the total allocation to $296,025.00; and

WHEREAS, the City of Norwalk has requested an increase of $138,975.00, thereby increasing the total allocation to $573,975.00.
NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners, Huron County Board of Commissioners, and the City of Norwalk, agree to the above stated addendum, thereby decreasing Huron County’s allocation of NSP funds to $296,025.00 and increasing the City of Norwalk’s allocation of NSP funds to $573,975.00. Said funds shall be decreased and increased in accordance with the requirements of the NS Program as promulgated by the U.S. Department of Housing and Urban Development, and the Ohio Department of Development.

Motion by Blair, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.

Motion carried.





____________________

RESOLUTION NO. 10-619

In the matter of awarding a contract for
        ) 

Christopher & Brandy Kelly to receive
        )  

grant assistance from CHIP FY08 Private       )


September 1, 2010

Owner Rehabilitation activity, which includes)

contingency for any unseen changes
        ) 


WHEREAS, Lorain County has received funding for Private Owner Rehabilitation in Fiscal Year 2008 Community Housing Improvement Program  (CHIP/HOME) Funds from the Ohio Department of Development to provide assistance to low and moderate income families that own and occupy their home in accordance with the grant agreement, and 

WHEREAS, Christopher & Brandy Kelly have applied for assistance and been determined eligible for a grant, and

WHEREAS, Olde Towne Windows, 9501 US 250, Suite 1, Milan, Ohio, in the amount of $29,670.00 with a contingency of $2,968.00 

for a total of $32,638.00 for Christopher & Brandy Kelly, 855 Georgia Avenue, Amherst, Ohio, Parcel ID # 0500036105022, for renovations to their structure, 5 invitations to bid were sent out and 2 quotes were received, this being the most responsive bid complying with the specifications received.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby approve the above mentioned contracts with above mentioned contractors, on behalf above mentioned home owners, for Private Owner Rehabilitation work as a CHIP/HOME Private Owner Rehabilitation project.  Authorize payments to be paid from 2660.FY08.100.120.07.6200.6207, CHIP/HOME Funds, House Rehabilitation account.
Motion by Blair, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.

Motion carried.





____________________

RESOLUTION NO. 10-620

In the matter of awarding various contracts for

) 

homeowners to receive grant assistance from 

)
September 1, 2010 

CHIP FY08 Home Repair activity, which include
)

a contingency for any unforeseen change orders

)



















WHEREAS, Lorain County has received funding for home repairs in Fiscal Year 2008 Community Housing Improvement  Program Grant (CHIP) Formula Funds from the Ohio Department of Development to provide assistance to low and moderate income families in accordance with the grant agreement, and 

WHEREAS, all property owners have applied for assistance and been determined eligible for a grant, and

1. J.A. Kilby Enterprises, Inc., 7791 Maddock Road, North Ridgeville, Ohio, in the amount of $685.00 with a contingency of $69.00 for a total of $754.00 for Eugene & Betty Yangula, 565 Irving park Drive, Sheffield Lake, Ohio (Parcel ID #0300036105010), for a water heater replacement, 10 invitations to bid were sent out and 1 quote was received, this being the best and most responsive

2. Larry’s Roofing and remodeling,43000 Butternut Ridge Rd., Oberlin, Ohio, in the amount of $5,400.00, with a contingency of $540.00 for a total of $5,940.00 for James & Kimberly Fallon, 40889 Carlisle Avenue, Elyria (Carlisle Twp.), Ohio  (Parcel ID #1000008114010) for roof replacement, chimney work and gutters & downspouts, 13 invitations to bid were sent out and 5 quotes were received, this being the best and most responsive

Said payments will be paid from Acct #2660.FY08.100.116.07.6400.6421 (CHIP) Home Repair account.

Motion by Blair, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.

Motion carried.





____________________

RESOLUTION NO. 10-621

In the matter of awarding various contracts for

         ) 

homeowners to receive grant assistance from CDBG
         )
September 1, 2010

FY09 Home Repair activity for roof and furnace replacement,  ) 

which include a contingency for any unforeseen change orders )



















WHEREAS, Lorain County has received funding for home repairs in Fiscal Year 2009 Community Development Block Grant (CDBG) Formula Funds from the Ohio Department of Development to provide assistance to low and moderate income families in accordance with the grant agreement, and 

WHEREAS, all property owners have applied for assistance and been determined eligible for a grant, and

1. S & J Home Maintenance, 16532 Indian Hollow Road, Grafton, Ohio, in the amount of $4,950.00 with a contingency of $495.00 for a total of $5,445.00 for Tammi Shreve, 509 Hall Road, Carlisle Township, Ohio (Parcel ID #1000003123003) for furnace replacement.  7 Invitations to bid were sent out and 2 quotes were received, this being the best and most responsive.

2. Larry’s Roofing & Remodeling, Inc., 43000 Butternut Ridge Road, Oberlin, Ohio, in the amount of $6,750.00, with a contingency of $675.00 for a total of $7,425.00 for David Pinchbeck, 804 Valley Drive, Amherst, Ohio  (Parcel ID #0500005107010) for roof replacement, 10 Invitations to bid were sent out and 2 quotes were received, this being the best and most responsive. 

Said authorized payments will be paid from Acct #2060.FY09.100.116.07.6400.6421 Home Repair account.

Motion by Blair, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.

Motion carried.





____________________

RESOLUTION NO. 10-622

In the matter of authorizing various account transfers )

September 1, 2010

for Lorain County Veterans Office

        )


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize various account transfers for Lorain County Veterans Office.


Said transfers are as follows:


$
4,500.00
from
1000-0000-610-000-06-7070-7097
cover 2nd quarter





To
1000-0000-610-000-06-5040-0000


$
25,000.00
from
1000-0000-610-000-06-7070-7097
budget accts towards year end





To
1000-0000-610-000-06-5000-5001


$
2,500.00
from
1000-0000-610-000-06-0700-7097





To
1000-0000-610-000-06-6000-6000

$
4,000.00
from
1000-0000-610-000-06-7070-7097




To
1000-0000-610-000-06-7200-0000

$
1,000.00
from
1000-0000-610-000-06-7070-0000




To
1000-0000-610-000-06-6000-0000

$
1,200.00
from
1000-0000-610-000-06-7220-0000




To
1000-0000-610-000-06-6050-6050

$
9,088.29
from
1000-0000-610-000-06-7070-7088




To
1000-0000-610-000-06-7070-7097


Motion by Blair, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.

Motion carried.





_____________________

RESOLUTION NO. 10-623

In the matter of authorizing various appropriations, advances)

and repayments 




      )
September 1, 2010


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize various appropriations, advances and repayments.


Said appropriations are as follows:


$
200,000.00
to be appropriated to:
temp gen fund adv for Oberlin Av proj/comm. gen fund


$
200,000.00
to
1000-0000-999-000-01-9900-9901


$
200,000.00
to be appropriated to:
gen fund adv/highway planning & construction


$
200,000.00
to
5210-5227-300-000-10-6200-6218


$
200,000.00
to be appropriated to:
repayment of gen fund adv/cdbg


$
200,000.00
to
2060-fy07-999-000-07-9900-9901


Said advances as follows:


$
200,000.00
from
1000-0000-999-000-01-9900-9901
temp gen fund adv for Oberlin Ave proj/gen fund to 

To
5210-5227-999-000-10-4900-4901
highway planning construction fund


Said repayment as follows:


$
200,000.00
from
2060-fy07-999-000-07-9900-9901
repayment of gen fund adv/cbdg to gen





To
1000-0000-999-000-01-4900-4901


Motion by Blair, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.


Motion carried.





_____________________

RESOLUTION NO. 10-624

In the matter of approving and entering into an )

Independent Psychological Services agreement )

between the Board of Commissioners and Dr.    )

Koricke Ph.D. on behalf of the Lorain County    )

September 1, 2010

Court of Common Pleas, Domestic Relations -   )

Juvenile Division effective September 1, 2010    )

to August 31, 2011



) 

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby approve and enter into the agreement between the Board of Commissioners and Deborah Koricke, Ph. D on behalf of the Lorain County Court of Common Pleas, Domestic Relations - Juvenile Division. 

Said agreement and memo of understanding is considered a part hereof to this resolution by reference thereto and can be found on file in Commissioners/Domestic Relations Office.  This agreement is effective September 1, 2010 to August 31, 2011, with a 30-day cancellation clause.

FURTHER BE IT RESOLVED, the County Commissioners and the Domestic Relations Court shall each pay 50% of each invoice received pursuant to this contract including any out of pocket expenses related to seminars/trainings that the Court requests the contractor to attend. Said payments shall be paid from the contract service line item.  


Motion by Blair, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.


Motion carried.





_____________________

RESOLUTION NO. 10-625

In the matter of approving & entering into contract with )

Maximus for 2010 indirect cost allocation plan for 2012  )
September 1, 2010

 in amount of $17,500




)

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby approve & enter into contract with Maximus for 2010 indirect cost allocation plan for 2012 in amount of $17,500.

Said contract is considered a part hereof to this resolution by reference thereto and can be found on file in the Commissioners/Purchasing Office and contains a 30 day cancellation clause.

Motion by Blair, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.

Motion carried.





____________________

RESOLUTION NO. 10-626

In the matter of approving and enter into a Purchase of )

Service Contract with The Workforce Institute for the   )

September 1, 2010

Purchase of One Stop Services Coordinator, effective    )

Retroactive to July 1, 2010 – June 30, 2011                    )


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby approve and enter into a Purchase of Service Contract with The Workforce Institute for the Purchase of One Stop Services Coordinator, effective retroactive to July 1, 2010 – June 30, 2011.

Said contract is considered a part hereof to this resolution by reference thereto and can be found on file in the Commissioners/Purchasing Office & Workforce Institute, contains a 60 day cancellation clause.

Motion by Blair, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.

Motion carried.





____________________

RESOLUTION NO. 10-627

In the matter of authorizing the County Administrator)

to execute a letter of intent for the St. Joes Center/      )

South Shore Building, Lorain, Ohio on behalf of the   )

September 1, 2010

Commissioners once completed


        )


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize County Administrator to execute a letter of intent for the St. Joes Center/South Shore Building, Lorain, Ohio on behalf of the Commissioners once completed.

Motion by Blair, seconded by Kokoski to adopt Resolution. Ayes: All.

Motion carried.





____________________









JOURNAL ENTRY


With no further business before the Board, Motion by Blair, seconded by Kalo to adjourn at 11:05 a.m., Ayes: All


Motion carried.

The meeting then adjourned.








​​​​​​​​​​​​_____________________________________________)Commissioners








Betty Blair, President



            )














            )







__________________________________________    _)of








Ted Kalo, Vice-president


            )














            )








_____________________________________________)Lorain County








Lori Kokoski , Member


            )Ohio

Attest:________________________________, Clerk
Please note that the Commissioners’ meetings are open to the public.  The scheduled air times for the meetings will be shown on Saturday at 12:00 Noon and Monday at 11:00 p.m. subject to change at the discretion of the Lorain County Community College.  The meetings might be also broadcasted in additional time periods as scheduling permits.  If anyone wants to purchase a copy of the  Commissioners Meeting Tapes, please call Lorain County Records Center at 440-326-4866.
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