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 June 1, 2016

The Board of Commissioners of Lorain County, Ohio met this day in a regular meeting, in the J. Grant Keys Administration Building, 
226 Middle Avenue, Elyria, Ohio, at 9:35 a.m. with the following members present: Commissioner Matt Lundy, President, Commissioner Ted 

Kalo, Vice-President and Commissioner Lori Kokoski, Member and Clerk Theresa L. Upton.








JOURNAL ENTRY


Commissioners said the Pledge of Allegiance.

Commissioner Lundy gave Romans 12

Commissioner Kalo presented a 1 year old wolf found on West River Road and available Saturday or choose from 31 other dogs.


The following business was transacted


__________________ 
a.1







RESOLUTION NO. 16-
325
In the matter of confirming Investments as procured by the )

Lorain County Treasurer




    )
June 1 2016

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby confirm Investments as procured by the Lorain 

County Treasurer.
	
	DATE
	DESCRIPTION
	 AMOUNT 
	INTEREST EARNED  / ON
	cusip#
	INV WITH
	ACCT #

	1
	5/23/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	 $            6,168.67 
	Federal National Mortgage Assn, PO#12-0046
	3136GOWM9
	US BANK'
	001050976260

	2
	5/23/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	 $           4,750.00 
	Federal National Mortgage Assn, PO#13-0015
	3135GOXE8
	US BANK'
	001050976260

	3
	5/23/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	 $            1,750.00 
	Federal National Mortgage Assn, PO#13-0021
	3135GOXE8
	US BANK'
	001050976260

	4
	5/23/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	 $            5,150.00 
	Federal National Mortgage Assn, PO#14-0029
	3135GOXA6
	US BANK'
	001050976260

	5
	5/23/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	 $           5,000.00 
	Federal Farm Credit Bank, PO#15-0026
	3133EEM98
	US BANK'
	001050976260

	6
	5/25/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	 $           2,875.00 
	Federal  Home Loan Bank, PO#15-0027
	3134G6U43
	US BANK'
	001050976260

	7
	5/25/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	 $             1,718.75 
	Federal Home Loan Mortgage, PO#15-0030
	3134G62E2
	US BANK'
	001050976260

	8
	5/25/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	 $            3,529.17 
	Federal National Mortgage Assn, PO#16-0002
	3136G06Q9
	US BANK'
	001050976260

	9
	5/27/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	 $            2,215.00 
	Federal National Mortgage Assn, PO#13-0016
	3135GOXL2
	US BANK'
	001050976260

	10
	5/27/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	$4,000.00 
	Federal National Mortgage Assn, PO#14-0001
	3136G1M55
	US BANK'
	0010509796260

	11
	5/27/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	$4,375 
	Federal Home Loan Bank, PO#15-0028
	3130A5FR5
	US BANK'
	001050976260

	12
	5/27/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	$5,500.00 
	Federal Home Loan Mortgage, PO#15-0029
	3134G63JO
	US BANK'
	0010509796260

	13
	05/27/196
	INT PAYMENT
	$2,375.00 
	Federal Home Loan Bank, PO315-0034
	3130A5KF5
	US BANK'
	001050976260

	14
	5/27/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	$5,000.00 
	Federal Home Loan Mortgage, PO315-0044
	3134G44S4
	US BANK'
	001050976260

	15
	5/27/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	$215.95 
	Federal Home Loan Bank, PO315-0049
	3130A6H34
	US BANK'
	001050976260



Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________
a.2







RESOLUTION NO. 16-326
In the matter of authorizing various appropriations)

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize various appropriations.
$
8,721.82
to be appropriated to:
salary reimburse form lcjvs & exp from lcswmd/sheriff gf
$
84.08

to
1000-0000-100-136-01-5060-0000

4
1,818.90
to
1000-0000-100-136-01-5080-5080

4
8.25

to
1000-0000-100-136-01-5080-5081

$
4,531.49
to
1000-0000-500-000-03-5000-5005

$
1,049.52
to
1000-0000-500-000-03-5040-0000

$
133.56

to
1000-0000-550-000-03-5100-0000

$
235.15

to
1000-0000-550-000-03-6000-0000

$
768.71

to
1000-0000-550-000-03-6000-6000

$
92.36

to
1000-0000-550-000-03-6200-6202

$
700,000.00
to be appropriated to:
partial reinstate of org submitted 2016 approp org budget submission for 16 was decreased due

$
700,000.00
to
2580-0000-300-300-04-5000-5001
 to not enough carryover to subsidize appro/eng mvgt

$
32,000.00
to be appropriated to:
reimburse left for grant funded lease vehicles/lcdtf drug task /meg

$
32,000.00
to
3440-0000-550-000-03-6050-6050

$
200,000.00
to be appropriated to:
inc exp asoc w/new hires while in training/911

$
150,000.00
to
3480-0000-100-000-03-5000-5001

$
50,000.00
to
3480-0000-100-000-03-5080-5080

$
22,712.90
to be appropriated to:
dare grant funding from lcsolid waste/sheriff drug education

$
22,712.90
to
3540-0000-550-000-03-7070-0000

$
100,000.00
to be appropriated to:
amend po for lc visitor’s bureau for funding needs/comm. hotel/motel

$
100,000.00
to
8016-0000-100-000-014-7300-7302


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________
a.3







RESOLUTION NO. 16-327
In the matter of authorizing various account & fund transfers)

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize various account & fund transfers.

$
43,200.00
from
1000-0000-100-102-10-6100-0000
vests for sheriff’s office/res#16-323 approved 5/25/16/capital impro gf




To
1000-0000-100-102-10-6050-0000

$
1,000.00
from
1000-0000-100-116-01-6200-0000
inc po for xceligent to include set up costs org left out tlc to reimburse

To
1000-0000-100-116-01-6200-6218
 50% cost/comm. dev gf

$
40,000.00
from
1000-0000-999-000-01-9900-9900
temp gf adv to community dev cdbg/comm. alloc gf




To
1000-0000-999-000-01-9900-9901

$
150,000.00
from
1000-0000-999-000-01-9900-9900
temp gf adv to workforce dev for tanf summer youth program/comm.

To
1000-0000-999-000-01-9900-9901
alloc gf


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________
a.4







RESOLUTION NO. 16-328
In the matter of authorizing various advances/repayments)


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize various advances/repayments.

Advances:
$
40,000.00
from
1000-0000-999-000-01-9900-9900
temp gf adv to community dev cdbg be repaid when st funds recd



To
2060-dt15-999-000-07-4900-4901
$
150,000.00
from
1000-0000-999-000-01-9900-9900
temp gf adv to workforce dev for tanf summer youth program

To
2300-0000-999-000-06-4900-4901
repaid upon state funding

Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________

a.5







RESOULTION NO. 16-329
In the matter of authorizing the purchase of supplies and)

Services for various county departments


)
June 1 2016


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize the purchase of supplies and services for various County departments.

	LOG #
	DEPARTMENT
	FUND
	DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE
	VENDOR
	AMOUNT

	 822 
	9-1-1 Agency 
	3480
	Brother PDS-5000 Document Scanner
	CDW-G 
	        2,310.00 

	 823
	Auditor’s
	1000
	Transcript Package Regarding NRG Power 
	Anderson Reporting Serv. 
	        3,951.20

	 824
	Auditor’s
	2480
	Software Maintenance Renewal ARCGIS
	Environmental Systems
	      25,318.56  

	 825
	CBCF
	8300
	HON Pneumatic Task Chair 
	Office Depot 
	        2,463.86   

	 826
	CBCF
	8300
	Cisco IP Phone, Acer Aspire Desktop Comp. 
	Office Depot
	        5,480.64  

	 827
	CBCF
	8300
	Washer Extractor, Steel Base, Dryer 
	Lakeside Laundry Equip. 
	      20,586.00   

	 828
	CBCF
	8300
	Digital Portable, Tune & Program, Battery 
	Vasu Communications, Inc. 
	        8,427.00

	 829
	CBCF
	8300
	16 Key Module, Smart Keys, Shipping
	Morse Watchmans 
	        3,506.25

	 830
	CBCF
	8300
	5-Tier Shelving Units
	Lowes Companies 
	        1,709.64

	 831
	CBCF
	8300
	TimeTrak Time & Attendance Software, Etc
	Cleveland Time Clock 
	        6,820.00 

	 832
	CBCF
	8300
	Convertible Bunk Beds, Ladders, Mattresses
	OPI Correctional Industries 
	      40,159.00

	 833
	CBCF
	8300
	Acer Travel/Mate P256-M Notebooks
	Office Depot 
	        2,749.95

	 834
	Commissioner’s
	8016
	Amend PO 2016001428 Hotel/Motel Tax
	Lorain County Visitor’s 
	    250,000.00 

	 835
	Engineer’s
	2580
	Ohio Public Works Loan Payment 
	Treasurer State of Ohio 
	      30,315.30   

	 836
	Engineer’s
	2580
	SBPO Jan-Dec Highway Safety Program 
	Great Lakes Truck Driving
	        5,150.00

	 837
	Engineer’s
	2580
	Auto Desk Infrastructure Design 2017
	DLT Solutions LLC 
	        3,139.11

	 838
	Hospitalization 
	7000
	Group Benefits Consulting Services 
	Findley Davies 
	        3,000.00

	 839
	Job & Family 
	2280
	Access Door Readers
	Safe Harbor Security & Fire
	        1,350.00

	 840
	Maintenance
	1000
	Repairs Needed for Asphalt Parking Lot 
	Purple Marlin dba Maint. 
	        8,679.00

	 841
	Maintenance 
	2220
	Repairs Needed for Asphalt Parking Lot 
	Purple Marlin dba Maint. 
	        2,475.00

	842 
	Prosecutor’s
	3560
	LEA Payments 
	Lorain County Prosecutor
	        7,870.00

	 843
	Sanitary Eng.
	7100
	Flow Monitoring Equipment for WWTP
	Advance Instruments
	      25,229.00

	 844
	Sheriff’s
	2200
	2016 Annual Fee Accreditation Fee 
	National Commission 
	        3,241.00

	 845
	Solid Waste
	2260
	Wooden Shipping Pallets for Collection Ctr
	Dobi Pallets, Inc. 
	        2,650.00

	 846
	Transit
	7200
	Audio/Video Security Cameras for Buses 
	Pro-Vision, Inc. 
	      27,079.00



Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as. Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________
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RESOLUTION NO. 16-330
In the matter of authorizing Travel Expenses to various)

personnel to attend meetings of interest to their              )

June 1 2016

departments




           )



BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize travel expenses to various personnel to 

Attending meeting of interest to their departments.

	LOG #
	DEPARTMENT
	NAME
	EVENT
	LOCATION
	DATE
	AMOUNT not 

exceed

	208 
	Engineer’s
	Carney, Kenneth 
	CEAO Land Records Modernization 
Conference
	Columbus, OH 
	6/21/16
	149.00

	209
	Engineer’s
	Zwick, Peter
	CEAO Land Records Modernization Conference
	Columbus, OH 
	6/21/16
	149.00

	210
	Engineer’s
	Spillman, Theodore
	CEAO Land Records Modernization Conference
	Columbus, OH 
	6/21/16
	149.00

	211
	Job & Family Services 
	Meade, Tina
	ABD Case Management 
	Cleveland, OH 
	6/2/16
	40.00

	212
	Job & Family Services
	Wanderi, Lucy 
	ABD Case Management
	Cleveland, OH 
	6/14/16
	10.00

	213
	Job & Family Services
	Molnar, Joe
	ABD Case Management 
	Cleveland, OH 
	6/14/16
	40.00

	214
	Job & Family Services
	Hart, Janice
	C3A Consortium and the Elder Abuse/Domestic 
Violence Round  Table
	Warrensville Hts, 
	6/10/16
	85.00

	215 
	Job & Family Services
	Griffin, Kathryn 
	C3A Consortium and the Elder Abuse/Domestic 
Violence Round Table
	Warrensville Hts.,
	6/10/16
	115.00

	216
	Job & Family Services
	Sounders, Kelli 
	ABD Case Management 
	Cleveland, OH 
	6/14/16
	10.00

	217
	Job & Family Services
	Maldonado, Melissa
	ABD Case Management
	Cleveland, OH 
	6/14/16
	10.00

	218
	Job & Family Services
	Curtis, Denise
	ABD Case Management
	Cleveland, OH 
	6/14/16
	10.00

	219
	Job & Family Services
	Kurtz Laudato, Donna
	ABD Case Management 
	Cleveland, OH 
	6/14/16
	40.00

	220
	Job & Family Services
	Martinez, Michelle
	ABD Case Management 
	Cleveland, OH 
	6/13/16
	10.00

	221
	Job & Family Services
	Newman, Melissa
	ABD Case Management 
	Cleveland, OH 
	6/13/16
	10.00

	222
	Job & Family Services
	Zelenak, Tammy 
	ABD Case Management 
	Cleveland, OH 
	6/13/16
	10.00

	223
	Job & Family Services
	Holloway, Laura
	ABD Case Management
	Cleveland, OH 
	6/13/16
	40.00

	224
	Job & Family Services
	Gray, Darlene
	ABD Case Management 
	Cleveland, OH 
	6/13/16
	10.00

	225
	Job & Family Services
	Pardon, Alisha
	ABD Case Management 
	Cleveland, OH 
	6/13/16
	10.00

	226
	Job & Family Services
	Wagner, Lynne
	ABD Case Management
	Cleveland, OH
	6/13/16
	40.00



Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





_________________
a.7







RESOLUTION NO. 16-331






APPROVING BILLS FOR PAYMENT


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby approve the following bills for payment, which have been signed by two or more Commissioners:

	VENDOR
	PURPOSE
	ACCOUNT #
	AMOUNT

	General Fund 
	 
	 
	

	Applied Industrial Technologies 
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6000 0000
	$375.58 

	Aztec Steel 
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6000 0000
	$131.10 

	Capp Inc. 
	Equipment
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6050 0000
	$477.88 

	Central Exterminating Co. 
	Repair & Building Maintenance
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6380 0000
	$280.00 

	Chronicle Telegram 
	Legal Notice
	1000 0000 100 142 01 7220 0000
	$252.90 

	Chronicle Telegram 
	Legal Notice
	1000 0000 100 142 01 7220 0000
	$141.12 

	Fayette Flag & Banner Supply LLC
	Equipment
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6050 0000
	$413.62 

	Friends Service Co. Inc dba FriendsOffice
	Equipment
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6050 0000
	$585.57 

	Friends Service Co. Inc dba FriendsOffice
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 100 01 6000 0000
	$29.61 

	Friends Service Co. Inc dba FriendsOffice
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 100 01 6000 0000
	$59.22 

	Janine M Myers & Associates
	Court Reporting Services
	1000 0000 100 142 01 7000 7004
	$750.00 

	Koricke, PH.D Deborah dba Deborah Koricke
	Professional Services
	1000 0000 100 142 01 6200 6218
	$2,090.00 

	Leonard Interior Supply Inc. 
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6000 0000
	$58.30 

	Lorain County Landfill, LLC
	Refund
	1000 0000 100 142 01 7070 7089
	$357.06 

	LTE Inc. dba Lakeshore Tool & Equipment
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6000 0000
	$75.12 

	Sandusky Electric, Inc. 
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6000 0000
	$801.55 

	Staples Contract & Commercial 
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 108 01 6000 0000
	$94.58 

	United Refrigeration Inc. 
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6000 0000
	$124.91 

	Whitehouse Artesian Springs
	Water
	1000 0000 100 112 01 6000 0000
	$41.00 

	Young Investments Inc. dba Young Security 
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6000 0000
	$386.00 

	Young Investments Inc. dba Young Security 
	Equipment
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6050 0000
	$546.00 

	 
	 
	TOTAL 
	$8,071.12 

	Dog Kennel 
	
	
	

	Columbia Gas of Ohio 
	Utility Services
	2220 0000 100 000 05 6200 6202
	$40.00 

	Elyria Hardware
	Supplies
	2220 0000 100 000 05 6000 0000
	$14.38 

	Lake Screen Printing
	Printing
	2220 0000 100 000 05 7220 0000
	$300.00 

	Lorain Cnty Treasurer
	Indirect Costs
	2220 0000 100 000 05 7000 7000
	$81,151.00 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$81,505.38 

	Engineer's
	
	
	

	State of Ohio 
	Fees
	2580 0000 300 300 04 7070 0000
	$1,800.00 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$1,800.00 

	Golden Acres
	
	
	

	Amherst Manor, Inc. 
	Refund
	3424 0000 100 000 05 7070 7089
	$1,426.00 

	Columbia Gas of Ohio 
	Utility Services
	3424 0000 100 000 05 6200 6202
	$26.73 

	Ohio Edison
	Utility Services
	3424 0000 100 000 05 6200 6202
	$936.43 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$2,389.16 


	Crime Lab 
	
	
	

	Advanced Computer Technologies, LLC
	Contract Services
	3460 0000 100 000 03 6200 0000
	$196.80 

	Cerilliant Corp 
	Supplies
	3460 0000 100 000 03 6000 0000
	$101.15 

	Friends Service Co Inc dba FriendsOffice
	Supplies
	3460 0000 100 000 03 6000 0000
	$76.62 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$374.57 

	9-1-1 Agency 
	
	
	

	Dickman Directories 
	Supplies
	3480 0000 100 000 03 6000 0000
	$329.50 

	First Impression Mats
	Mat Rental 
	3480 0000 100 000 03 6600 6603
	$112.66 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$442.16 

	Hospitalization 
	
	
	

	Lorain Cnty Treasurer
	Indirect Costs
	7000 7000 100 000 12 7000 7000
	$25,850.00 

	Reliastar Life Insurance Company 
	Life Insurance Invoice
	1030 0000 100 000 01 5080 5086
	$14,982.00 

	Reliastar Life Insurance Company 
	Life Insurance Invoice
	1030 0000 100 000 01 5080 5086
	$9,216.45 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$50,048.45 

	Workers' Compensation 
	
	
	

	Lorain Cnty Treasurer
	Indirect Costs
	7010 0000 100 000 11 7000 7000
	$6,229.00 

	Correcting Entry for Retrospective Claims Costs
	Costs
	7010 0000 100 000 12 7000 7017
	$133,383.29 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$139,612.29 

	Sanitary Engineer's
	
	
	

	Bodnar Printing Company 
	Sanitary Billing Statements
	7100 7100 300 304 11 7220 0000
	$998.69 

	Gross Plumbing, Inc. 
	Supplies
	7100 7100 300 304 11 6000 0000
	$35.85 

	HD Supply Facilities Maint/dba USA Bluebook
	Supplies
	7100 7100 300 304 11 6000 0000
	$777.95 

	HD Supply Facilities Maint/dba USA Bluebook
	Other Expenses
	7100 7100 300 304 11 7070 0000
	$45.70 

	Lake Screen Printing Company 
	Contract Services
	7100 7100 300 304 11 6200 0000
	$210.60 

	Mission Communications
	Contract Services
	7100 7100 300 304 11 6200 0000
	$694.80 

	Pinkerton, David s. dba Abel Sanitary Service
	Contract Services
	7100 7100 300 304 11 6200 0000
	$780.00 

	Polen Implement, Inc. 
	Supplies
	7100 7100 300 304 11 6000 0000
	$13.74 

	Romco Fire and Safety Equipment
	Supplies
	7100 7100 300 304 11 6000 0000
	$900.00 

	Swift First Aid 
	Supplies
	7100 7100 300 304 11 6000 0000
	$99.80 

	Swift First Aid 
	Other Expenses
	7100 7100 300 304 11 7070 0000
	$8.95 

	
	
	TOTAL 
	$4,566.08 

	Storm Water
	
	
	

	Lorain Cnty Treasurer
	Indirect Costs
	7100 7118 100 000 11 7000 7000
	$3,599.00 

	
	
	TOTAL 
	$3,599.00 

	Transportation Center
	
	
	

	Strnad Foods, Inc. dba Dale's Market & Deli 
	Food for Event 
	7200 7200 100 150 11 6000 0000
	$48.54 

	
	
	TOTAL 
	$48.54 

	Airport
	
	
	

	Great Lakes Petroleum 
	Supplies
	7300 0000 100 000 11 6000 0000
	$781.66 

	MRK Aviation, Inc. 
	Repairs
	7300 0000 100 000 11 6380 0000
	$100.00 

	MRK Aviation, Inc. 
	Other Expenses
	7300 0000 100 000 11 7070 0000
	$1,200.00 

	Ohio Edison
	Utility Services
	7300 0000 100 000 11 6200 6202
	$66.97 

	
	
	TOTAL 
	$2,148.63 


Job & Family Services:
HS H16-1105



Administrative payroll



TOTAL

$345,239.33

Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.
Motion carried.





__________________
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JOURNAL ENTRY


County Administrator Cordes requested an executive session to discuss personnel, updated on labor negotiations with DD, LCCS & USW and purchase/sale real estate.



________________(discussion was held on the above)
a.9







RESOLUTION NO. 16-332
In the matter of approving & waiving the reading of the     )

same for the Lorain County Board of Commissioners         )
June 1 2016

meeting minutes of May 25, 2016


   ) 


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby approve & waive the reading of the same for the Lorain County Board of Commissioners meeting minutes.

For May 25 2016


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________
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RESOLUTION NO. 16-333
In the matter of awarding a contract to Absolute Roofing and )

Construction, Inc. for the 2016 Roof Replacement / Repair     )
June 1, 2016

projects






       )

WHEREAS, bid were received and opened on Thursday, May 12, 2016 for the 2016 Roof Replacement / Repair projects as follows:

LOCATION

CRM


ABSOLUTE

WEATHERTIGHT

SIBLEY

374 Broad Street
150,845
  

97,800


150,860



139,235

Alt. 1


   9,630
  

11,800*


 (1200 per skylight)

 12,670

Gateway Blvd.

Records Center

No bid


 57,200


 70,495



 62,255

1064/1080 Infirmary

Juvenile Pods

No bid


 45,000


 59,645



 62,485

Repairs:

322 N. Gateway

No bid

 
4,500


 7,500



  6,000

42110 Russia Rd.
No bid


 5,000 


 5,000



  3,500

45999 N. Ridge Rd
No bid


10,000


80,000*



  9,500

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we do and hereby award the contract for the 2016 Roof Replacement / Repair projects to Absolute Roofing and Construction, Inc., Cleveland, Ohio. Funds are available from capital improvement accounts based on location and project.  


BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that we do and hereby issue a Notice to Proceed effective on or before June 13, 2016.  


FURTHER BE IT RESOLVED, the County Administrator is hereby granted the authority to notify the County Auditor to release retainage at the completion of the contract.

Said bid was the lowest and most responsive bids received complying with specifications.


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________








COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT

a.11







RESOLUTION NO. 16-334
In the matter of amending a Lorain County Recycling Revolving)

loan fund agreement with ADI Wind, Sheffield Village, Ohio     ) June 1, 2016


WHEREAS, July 30, 2009, Resolution No. 09-519, Commissioners accepted recommendation of the Lorain County Recycling Revolving Loan Fund Oversight Committee as determined at the meeting on July 21, 2009 to approve a Recycling Revolving Loan Fund Application submitted by ADI Wind, Sheffield Village, Ohio  in the amount of  $130,000.00 for the purchase of recycled machinery and equipment for the development of a prototype wind turbine gearbox thereby removing these items from the waste stream; and


WHEREAS, said addendum to loan agreement is considered a part hereof as follows:


WHEREAS, ADI Wind (the “Borrower”) and the Lorain County Board of Commissioners (the “Lender”) have agreed on this 1st day of June 2016 to enter into this addendum to the Congnovit Promissory Note that they entered into in July of 2009;

WHEREAS, it was originally agreed that the loan was to be paid over sixty (60) months at rate of 2.25% per annum; 


WHEREAS, the parties wish to amend the repayment terms of the original loan so that the loan shall be paid over ninety (90) months and repayment will restart in July of 2016 and complete in June of 2017;

WHEREAS, all late fees and accrued interest payments will be added to the remaining loan balance;


WHEREAS, the balance of the loan shall be re-amortized over twelve (12) months at a rate of 5.50% per annum;


WHEREAS, the parties also herein agree that all other documents related to this loan, including the Loan Agreement, Open-End Mortgage, Security Agreement and Guaranty shall take into consideration this addendum where the timing of the execution of those documents nay be affected;

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Lorain County Board of Commissioners and ADI Wind have executed this addendum as of the date indicated above.


Lorain County Board of Commissioners


By: S/Matthew R. Lundy, President of Board


ADI WIND


By: ______________________________


Name: ____________________________


Title: _____________________________


Approved As to form: ________________


NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOVLED, said agreement extends the term of loan, capitalizes late fee and accrued interest & balance is $7,973.09, interest rate is 5.5% and repayments will commence on July 1, 2016, final payment of June 1, 2017 of $685/month.


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________








WORKFORCE DEVELOPMENT
a.12







RESOLUTION NO. 16-335
In the matter of  extending the MOU between )

the Board of Commissioners, Lorain County   )

Workforce Development Board and the           )


June 1, 2016
OhioMeansJobs partners for FY 2017,             )

effective July 1, 2016 - June 30, 2017              )


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby extend the MOU between the Board of Commissioners, Lorain County Workforce Development Board and the OhioMeansJobs Lorain County partners for FY 2017, effective July 1, 2016 - June 30, 2017.


FURTHER BE IT RESOLVED, said resolution is to reflect the total cost of the MOU is $325,934.00 and we hereby authorize payment of such as follows;


“OhioMeansJobs Lorain County partners and their share of the MOU are as follows:


ODJFS




$107,023.10


OOD




$    4,864.69


LCWDA



$170,264.02


LCDJFS



$    9,729.37


ABLE




$    4,864.69


LCJVS




$    4,864.69


Mature Services E&T Solutions

$  14,594.06


LCCAA 



$    4,864.69


LCCC    



$    4,864.69






$325,934.00


Said agreement is considered a part hereof to this resolution by reference thereto and can be found on file in the Commissioners/Purchasing and Lorain County Workforce Development Agency, effective July 1, 2016 - June 30, 2017.


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________









ENGINEER

a.13







RESOLUTION NO. 16-336
In the matter of authorizing the County Administrator  )

to release the retainage along with any accrued interest)

to Schirmer Construction LLC, North Olmsted, Ohio   )  

June 1, 2016

for the Sugar Ridge Road Bridge #0214 Design/Build  )

Replacement Project in North Ridgeville, Ohio             )

 
WHEREAS, Ken Carney, Lorain County Engineer by letter dated May 27, 2016 submitted the following:

“In January of 2014, the Lorain County Board of Commissioners adopted Resolution No. 14-49 awarding a contract in the amount of $306,600.00 to Schirmer Construction LLC. Of North Olmsted, Ohio for the Sugar Ridge Road Bridge #0214 Design/Build Replacement Project in North Ridgeville, Ohio.  Funding in the amount of $142,416 was provided by the Ohio Department of Transportation, Office of Jobs and Commerce.  The balance was split between the City of North Ridgeville and the Office of the Lorain County Engineer. 

       
Construction is now complete and the bridge has been accepted by the engineer.


At this time, the engineer’s office is respectfully requesting that the Board of Commissioners take the necessary action to authorize the County Administrator to release the retainage along with any accrued interest.  Thank you for your assistance with this project and please do not      hesitate to contact Robert Klaiber or myself at 440-329-5586 if you should have any additional questions.”;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Lorain County Commissioners, that based upon the request of Lorain County Engineer in letter dated May 27, 2016 we do hereby authorize the County Administrator to release the retainage along with any accrued interest, to Schirmer Construction LLC, North Olmsted, Ohio for the Sugar Ridge Road Bridge #0214 Design/Build Replacement project in North Ridgeville, Ohio.    


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________

a.14







RESOLUTION NO. 16-337
In the matter of awarding a 2 year contract to     )

Denny’s Lawn Care, Vermilion, Ohio in the       )

amount of $14,400.00 for mowing of  2016        )  

June 1, 2016

Detention Basins under County Maintenance      )

     
WHEREAS, Ken Carney, Lorain County Engineer, by letter dated May 25, 2016 submitted the following:

 
“Bids were received on April 22, 2016 for mowing of detention basins that are under County Maintenance.


 Five bids were received for a 2 year contract as follows:

     

Lockes GoGreen Landscaping

$12,072.00



Denny’s Lawn Care


  14,400.00



Big Trees



  15,430.00



Born’s




  19,060.00 



Nagel Masonry 



  22,950.00

     
Based on past experiences with Lockes GoGreen Landscaping as outlined in the attached letter from our Highway Foreman, we recommend the award to Denny’s Lawn Care in the amount of $14,400.00.  The Engineer’s estimate on the project was $20,000.00.  Denny’s Lawn Care has performed successfully on other projects with the County.  Please call if you have any questions on this project.”;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Board of Lorain County Commissioners that based upon letter dated May 25, 2016 submitted by Ken Carney, Lorain County Engineer we hereby award a 2 year contract to Denny’s Lawn Care of Vermilion, Ohio in the amount of $14,400.00 for mowing of detention basins that are under County Maintenance. 


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________

a.15







RESOLUTION NO. 16-338
In the matter of awarding contract to                 )

Cross Roads Asphalt Recycling, Columbia      )

Station Ohio in the amount of $724,947.50      ) 


June 1, 2016

for the Lorain County 2016 Chip and Seal       )

Program                                                              )  

     
WHEREAS, Ken Carney, Lorain County Engineer, by letter dated May 24, 2016 submitted the following:

“On May 18, 2016, bids were received by the Lorain County Engineer for the Lorain County 2016 Chip and Seal Program.  The 2016 program totals nearly 55 centerline miles and eleven townships are participating in this year’s bid.  The respondents to this bid were as follows:

Cross Roads Asphalt Recycling                           $724,947.50                                    

Henry W. Bergman, Inc.                                      $745,242.50                                      

Erie Blacktop                                                        $789,496.00        

Specialized Construction                                      $818,435.00              

      
Bids have been reviewed and the Engineer’s Office recommends that this project be awarded to Cross Roads Asphalt Recycling, Inc., Columbia Station, Ohio in the amount of $724,947.50.  Cross Roads proposes to begin work on or before July 1, 2016 and complete all work by September 1, 2016.  Cross Roads does not propose using any subcontractors or substitutions on this project.

County highways as part of this program estimated to be $215,110.24 will be funded through MVGT Account #2580-0000-300-04-6100-6105 (Engineering Projects).  Participating townships will be billed based on unit bid prices and the actual amount of material used.  The   engineer’s estimate on the project was $824,000.00.

Thank you for your consideration and please feel free to contact Robert Klaiber or myself at 440-329-5586 if you should have any additional questions or comments.”; 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Lorain County Commissioners, that based upon the bids received and the review and recommendation by the Lorain County Engineer in letter dated May 24, 2016 we do hereby award contract to Cross Roads Asphalt Recycling, Columbia Station, Ohio in the amount of $724,947.50 for the Lorain County 2016 Chip and Seal Program.

     
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, we will Issue a Notice to Proceed letter as soon as possible and the work will be completed on or before September 1, 2016.

     
FURTHER BE IT RESOLVED, we hereby authorize the County Administrator to notify the county Auditor to release retainage at the completion of the project.


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________









SHERIFF

a.16







RESOLUTION NO. 16-339
In the matter of authorizing the Lorain County Sheriff      )

to apply for grant monies through FY16 Bryne Memorial  )
June 3, 2015

 Justice Assistance Grant (JAG)
to purchase miscellaneous)

equipment for the law enforcement division

  )

WHEREAS, Sheriff Stammitti by letter dated May 25, 2016 submitted the following:

“The FY2016 Edward Byrne Memorial Justice Assistance Grant (JAG) awards Local Solicitation from the Federal Bureau of Justice Assistance have been announced.  For federal fiscal year 2016 Lorain County and the Cities of Elyria and Lorain were awarded a combined amount of $44,120 with no local match required.

The Ohio Attorney General’s Office automatically certified a disparate allocation claim on behalf of Lorain County to include us in a share of this money. Neither the City nor the County will receive any of their respective grant monies until we mutually agree on how the combined grant funds will be allocated.

The allocation of the funds will be split according to the JAG local allocations & disparate information:

Elyria City
$14,707.00
Lorain City
$14,707.00
Lorain County
$14,706.00
I am requesting the Commissioner to pass a resolution authorizing:

1.
Commissioner Lundy, as president, to sign the Agreement on behalf of the entire board.

2.
The Sheriff to apply for the grant monies to purchase miscellaneous equipment for the law enforcement division (No local match required)

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, based upon the letter dated May 25, 2016 from Sheriff Stammitti we hereby authorize the Lorain County Sheriff to apply for grant monies through FY16 Byrne Memorial Justice Assistance Grant (JAG) to purchase miscellaneous equipment for the law enforcement division.

Motion by Kokoski, seconded by Lundy to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





_________________
a.17







RESOLUTION NO. 16-340

In the matter of entering into a renewal Operating Agreement)

With Aramark for food service, effective retroactive to           )

May 1, 2016 – April 30, 2017 with an increase of 2.74%         )
June 1, 2016


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby enter into a renewal Operating Agreement With Aramark for food service, effective retroactive to May 1, 2016 – April 30, 2017 with an increase of 2.74% at an annual increase of $14,750.00

Said agreement is considered a part hereof to this resolution as follows:

[image: image1.emf]         

[image: image2.emf]

Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________

b.







COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR











RESOLUTION NO. 16-341

In the matter of awarding a contract to JenMet Construction, )

LLC, Lorain in amount of $39,902.00 for Patricia DeAngelo )

Lorain, to receive grant assistance from CHIP PY14 Private  )   June 1, 2016

Owner Home Rehabilitation activity


      )

WHEREAS, Lorain County has received funding for home repairs and rehabilitation Program Year 2014 Community Housing and Impact Preservation (CHIP) funds from the Ohio Development Services Agency to provide assistance to low and moderate income families in accordance with the grant agreement, and 

WHEREAS, the owner has applied for assistance and been determined eligible for Private Owner Home Rehabilitation, and

JenMet Construction, LLC, 5000 Pearl Avenue, Lorain, Ohio in the amount of $36,275.00 with a contingency of $3,627.00 for a total of $39,902.00 for Patricia DeAngelo, 2088 Roosevelt Avenue, Lorain, Ohio, (Parcel ID #03-00-109-107-021) for Private Owner Home Rehabilitation work, this being the best and most responsive. 

Said payment will be paid from Acct CHIP PY14 HOME account.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that this resolution stands as authorization to pay invoices and the Lorain County Commissioners hereby authorize payment of such amounts upon completion and acceptance of the contracts. 


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________

c.







ASSISTANT COUNTY PROSECUTOR


Mr. Gerald Innes requested an executive session to discuss update on 1 pending court action








__________________
d.







COMMISSIONERS REPORT



Commissioner Kokoski hoped everyone had a nice Memorial Day weekend and it was nice walking in the Elyria & Lorain parades with Commissioner Lundy
Commissioner Kokoski attended the Goodwill meeting and they are still looking for a CEO


Commissioner Kalo hoped everyone had a nice Memorial Day, he missed the parades was in Tennessee meeting his son in laws family
Also he and his wife celebrated 19 years of marriage

Commissioner Lundy recognized NOACA and their long range transportation issue to 2040
Commissioner Lundy was unable to attend ElCentro Latino based economic event

Commissioner Lundy said the parades had a great turnout, nice weather and salute to the brave men and women








________________(discussion was held on the above)

e.







CLERK’S REPORT




#1.
June 7 at 9:30 a.m., Guthrie Ditch Hearing

__________________
f.







BOARD CORRESPONDENCE




Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to approve the Board Correspondence and waive the reading of the same.  Ayes: All.

Motion carried.

#1.
June 9, Sweetbriar Golf Club, County Chamber of Commerce Golf Outing looking for door prizes, www.loraincountychamber.com
#2.
County Veterans Service Commission requests a hearing on proposed budget increase of $46,000 under ORC 5901.11

#3.
True North Cultural Arts, Sheffield Village celebrating 17th season and September 1 will leave French Creek Nature & Arts Center to expand

#4.
Notice of Schedule for environmental review of Nexus Gas transmission and Texas eastern Appalachian lease project

#5.
May 7, LCCC Spitzer – Elyria Sports Hall of Fame Banquet brochure

#6.
Mental Health annual report 

#7.
Mike Hiler, Deputy Chief of Office of Community Development has been selected to serve as interim Chief of Community Services Division and Matt LaMantia, Assistance Deputy Chief of the Office of Community Development, serve as interim Deputy Chief of Office of Community Development due to the retirement of Karen Fabiano

#8.
Publications: “Ohio Turnpike Customer connection”; “County Chamber events”; “Intelligencer”: “One Way Farm”; “Lorain Library Dimensions”; “CCAO statehouse reports”; “Counties Count”; “Realtors & Smart Growth on common ground summer 2016”; “

#9.
2015 University Hospitals annual report to the community and report on Philanthropy








____________________
g.







PUBLIC COMMENT 



June 1, 2016






(Please limit your comments to three minutes)

There was no public comment for this day.

________________
JOURNAL ENTRY




Commissioner Lundy moved, seconded by Kalo to go into an executive session at 9:50 a.m. to discuss personnel, updated on labor negotiations with DD, LCCS & USW and purchase/sale real estate and update on pending litigation court action.  Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.
Motion carried.





_________________
Commissioners reconvened from executive session and no action was taken this day.

With no further business before the Board, Motion by Lundy seconded by Kalo to adjourn at 11:40 a.m. Ayes: All

Motion carried.

The meeting then adjourned.








_____________________________________________)Commissioners








Matt Lundy, President



            )














            )







__________________________________________    _)of








Ted Kalo, Vice-president


            )














            )








_____________________________________________)Lorain County








Lori Kokoski, Member



            )Ohio

Attest:________________________________, Clerk

Theresa L. Upton
Please note that the Commissioners’ meetings are open to the public.  The scheduled air times for the meetings will be shown on Saturday at 12:00 Noon and Monday at 11:00 p.m. subject to change at the discretion of the Lorain County Community College.  The meetings might be also broadcasted in additional time periods as scheduling permits.  If anyone wants to purchase a copy of the  Commissioners Meeting Tapes, please call Lorain County Records Center at 440-326-4866.
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