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June 29 2016

The Board of Commissioners of Lorain County, Ohio met this day in a regular meeting, in the J. Grant Keys Administration Building, 
226 Middle Avenue, Elyria, Ohio, at 9:31 a.m. with the following members present: Commissioner Matt Lundy, President, Commissioner Ted 

Kalo, Vice-President and Commissioner Lori Kokoski, Member and Clerk Theresa L. Upton.








JOURNAL ENTRY


Commissioners said the Pledge of Allegiance.

Commissioner Lundy gave Romans 14
Commissioner Kokoski presented a 3-4 year old female black puddle available tomorrow or choose from 31 other dogs, adopt before 

you shop


The following business was transacted


__________________ 
a.







APPOINTMENTS

9:45 a.m.
Elaine Georgas, Executive Director – Alcohol & Drug Addiction Services









__________________
b.1







RESOLUTION NO. 16-
400
In the matter of confirming Investments as procured by the )

Lorain County Treasurer




    )
June 29 2016

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby confirm Investments as procured by the Lorain 

County Treasurer.
	
	DATE
	DESCRIPTION
	 AMOUNT 
	INTEREST EARNED  / ON
	cusip#
	INV WITH
	ACCT #

	1
	6/17/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	$2,208.33 
	Federal National Mortgage Assn, PO#15-0067
	3136G2V53
	US BANK
	001050976260

	2
	6/17/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	$4,400.00 
	Federal Home Loan Bank, Po#14-0047
	3130A3P24
	US BANK
	001050976260

	3
	6/17/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	$3,125.00 
	Federal Home Loan Mortgage, PO#13-0036
	3134G4PH5
	US BANK
	001050976260

	4
	6/20/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	$4,375.00 
	Federal national mortgage, po#14-0014
	3135GORT2
	US BANK
	001050976260

	5
	6/20/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	$2,625.00 
	Federal Home Loan Bank, PO#15-0046
	313383F89
	US BANK
	001050976260

	6
	6/22/2016
	INT PAYMENT
	$5,750.00 
	Federal Home Loan Bank, PO#15-0033
	3130A5QAo
	US BANK
	001050976260



Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________
b.2







RESOLUTION NO. 16-401
In the matter of authorizing various appropriations)

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize various appropriations.
$
7,463.77
to be appropriated to:
reimburse from lc jvs for deputy salary & dept of public safety for ot/sheriff gf
$
33.69

to
1000-0000-100-136-01-5060-0000

$
909.45

to
1000-0000-100-136-01-5080-5080

$
8.25

to
1000-0000-100-136-01-5080-5081

$
6,038.45
to
1000-0000-550-000-03-5000-5005

$
420.50

to
1000-0000-550-000-03-5040-0000

4
53.43

to
1000-0000-550-000-03-5100-0000

$
5,415.00
to be appropriated to:
catholic charities case management for courts life skill prog/dr t-federal

$
5,415.00
to
2020-2027-400-404-03-6200-6218

$
13,000.00
to be appropriated to:
future vehicle exp and mis rentals/comm. solid waste

$
10,000.00
to
2260-0000-100-00-05-6380-6380

$
3,000.00
to
2260-0000-100-00-05-6600-6604

$
210,000.00
to be appropriated to:
inc tanf contracts & indirect cost to cover new po req for boys/girls club school clothes & 

$
210,000.00
to
2280-000-260-00-06-6200-6262
shoes prog/lcdjfs

$
1,270,000.00
to be appropriated to:
chip/seal; bridge proj; cooper foster; lear nagle proj/eng mvgt

$
1,200,000.00
to
2580-0000-300-300-04-6100-6105

$
70,000.00
to
2580-0000-300-302-04-6100-6105

$
6,440.00
to be appropriated to:
hire outside vendors move lab equip from courthouse to admin bldg part of courthouse renov

$
6,440.00
to
5000-5002-100-000-10-6200-6218
proj/comm.-construction bldg

$
23,590.00
to be appropriated to:
de-approp in order to allow transfer cash for 2nd half 16/17 exp/comm. ccffc

$(
13,165.00)
from
8100-fy16-100-000-14-5000-5001

4(
2,000.00)
from
8100-fy16-100-000-14-5040-0000

$(
245.00)

from
8100-fy16-100-000-14-5060-0000

$(
10,000.00)
from
8100-fy16-100-000-14-5080-5080

$
49,000.00
to
8100-fy16-999-000-14-9900-9900


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________
b.3







RESOLUTION NO. 16-402
In the matter of authorizing various account & fund transfers)

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize various account & fund transfers.

$
1,134.40
from
1000-0000-999-000-01-9900-9900
reimburse vac/sick leave payout for max Schaefer/auditor




To
1000-0000-200-000-01-5000-5001

$
687.02

from
3424-0000-100-000-05-6000-0000
refund for prior patient and cover work performed on fire

To
3424-0000-100-000-05-7070-7089
alarm/golden acres Medicaid
$
24.62

from
3424-0000-100-000-05-6000-6000




To
3424-0000-100-000-05-7070-7089

$
25.33

from
3424-0000-100-000-05-6000-6004




To
3424-0000-100-000-05-7070-0789

$
418.08

from
3424-0000-100-000-05-6050-0000




To
3424-0000-100-000-05-7070-7089

$
1,968.95
from
3424-0000-100-00-005-6200-0000




To
3424-0000-100-000-05-7070-7089

$
1,200.00
from
3424-0000-100-000-05-6200-6202




To
3424-0000-100-000-05-6380-6381

$
500.00

from
7300-0000-100-00-041-6050-0000
adv for work on taxilanes at airport/comm lcra




To
7300-0000-100-000-11-7220-0000

$
87.55

from
8240-fy16-100-000-14-6000-0000
harcourt data mng software for neighborhood alliance batelle dev

To
8240-fy16-100-000-14-6000-6009
inv/cffc

$
825,000.00
from
1000-0000-999-000-01-9900-9900
partial gf subsidy to supplement jail operations from approved gf

To
2200-0000-999-000-03-4900-4900
budget allocation approved effect 1/1/16/comm. gf jail

Fund Transfers;

$
49,000.00
from
8100-fy16-999-000-14-9900-9900
2nd half and start new fy17/comm. cffc




To
8100-fy17-999-000-14-4900-4900

Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________
b.3a







RESOLUTION NO. 16-403
In the matter of authorizing various fund transfers for the )

Payment of hospitalization for the month the 2nd quarter   )

For employees in the amount of $6,537,068.82
              )


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize various fund transfers for the payment of hospitalization for the 2nd quarter for employees in the amount of $6,537,068.82

	April - June 2016
	ACCOUNT NUMBER
	 AMOUNT 

	WORKFORCE DEVELOPMENT AGENCY
	1000.0000.100.114.06.5080.5080
	 $         7,845.12 

	GENERAL FUND DEPARTMENTS
	1000.0000.100.136.01.5080.5080
	 $ 2,049,549.42 

	PROSECUTOR IV-D                                                                    
	1000.0000.220.220.01.5080.5080
	 $       53,124.66 

	DOMESTIC RELATIONS/CHILD SUPPORT
	1000.0000.400.406.02.5080.5080
	 $       51,121.98 

	NEW RUSSIA TWP - SHERIFF
	1020.1023.550.000.03.5080.5080
	 $         5,456.70 

	ALCOHOL/DRUG ABUSE
	2000.2000.620.000.05.5080.5080
	 $       18,182.52 

	JAIL TAX
	2200.0000.550.000.03.5080.5080
	 $     577,488.36 

	DOG & KENNEL
	2220.0000.100.000.05.5080.5080
	 $       18,546.30 

	SOLID WASTE
	2260.0000.100.000.05.5080.5080
	 $       27,998.10 

	JOB/FAMILY IM
	2280.0000.260.000.06.5080.5080
	 $     515,800.26 

	JOB/FAMILY SS
	2280.0000.260.262.06.5080.5080
	 $       22,171.14 

	JOB/FAMILY SHARED
	2280.0000.260.264.06.5080.5080
	 $     146,729.16 

	COPS
	2323.2323.550.000.03.5080.5080
	 $                      -   

	REAL ESTATE
	2480.0000.200.000.01.5080.5080
	 $     117,788.28 

	DEL TAX (TREASURER)
	2500.2501.210.000.01.5080.5080
	 $         5,456.70 

	DEL TAX (PROSECUTOR)
	2500.2502.220.000.01.5080.5080
	 $         5,092.92 

	AUTO TITLE
	2520.0000.510.000.01.5080.5080
	 $       75,257.10 

	ADULT INT. PROBATION
	2560.2560.280.280.03.5080.5080
	 $       28,355.40 

	MISDEMEANOR GRANT -ADULT PRO.
	2560.2562.280.280.03.5080.5080
	 $         2,176.20 

	ADULT PRO. SUB ACCT.
	 2560.2563.280.280.03.5080.5080
	 $         2,176.20 

	ADULT PRO. PSI
	2560.2564.280.280.03.5080.5080
	 $       18,182.52 

	NON SUPPORT GRANT - ADULT PRO
	2560.2565.280.280.03.5080.5080
	 $         2,176.20 

	IMPROVEMENT GRANT-PROBATION
	2560.2566.280.280.03.5080.5080
	 $         5,456.70 

	ENGINEER
	2580.0000.300.300.04.5080.5080
	 $     218,502.12 

	IV-E
	2610.0000.400.000.02.5080.5080
	 $         4,729.14 

	FAMILY DRUG COURT
	2620 0000 400 407 03 5080 5080
	 $         2,176.20 

	DRUG COURT   - SPECIALIZED                                  
	2620.0000.400.416. 03.5080.5080
	 $         5,456.70 

	DRUG COURT                                  
	2620.0000.400.452.03.5080.5080
	 $                      -   

	MENTAL HEALTH COURT
	2630 0000 400 000 03 5080 5080
	 $         5,456.70 

	BRIDGE
	2640.0000.100.000.04.5080.5080
	 $       24,003.00 

	VOICES FOR CHILDREN
	2680.0000.400.428.06.5080.5080
	 $       13,089.60 

	RECLAIM OHIO
	2700.0000.400.412.06.5080.5080
	 $       16,370.10 

	DAY TREATMENT
	2700.0000.400.414.06.5080.5080
	 $         6,528.60 

	STEPPING STONE
	2700.0000.400.418.06.5080.5080
	 $       39,123.72 

	SEX OFFENDER
	2700.0000.400.422.06.5080.5080
	 $         5,456.70 

	RESTITUTION
	2700.0000.400.430.06.5080.5080
	 $         2,176.20 

	IN-HOME 2
	2700.0000.400.438.06.5080.5080
	 $         8,851.98 

	RECLAIM TRUANCY
	2700.0000.400.448.06.5080.5080
	 $       22,534.92 

	SPECIAL FUND - PROBATE
	2840.2846.500.000.01.5080.5080
	 $                      -   

	COUNTY PROBATION SERV.
	2940.0000.280.280.03.5080.5080
	 $         9,809.10 

	LAW LIBRARY
	3110.0000.650.000.02.5080.5080
	 $         7,632.90 

	COURT MEDIATION
	3140.0000.360.000.03.5080.5080
	 $         7,632.90 

	CHILDREN SERVICES
	3200.0000.580.000.06.5080.5080
	 $     464,876.76 

	CCW-FUND SHERIFF
	3260.0000.550.000.03.5080.5080
	 $                      -   

	MURRAY RIDGE - FUND 250
	3280.0000.590.000.06.5080.5080
	 $ 1,097,813.27 

	MURRAY RIDGE -FUND 251
	3300.0000.590.000.05.5080.5080
	 $     134,529.70 

	MURRAY RIDGE FUND 253
	3320.0000.590.000.05.5080.5080
	 $     132,083.63 

	MENTAL HEALTH
	3340.A100.600.A16.05.5080.5080
	 $       51,307.00 

	COUNTY HOME
	3422.0000.100.000.05.5080.5080
	 $                      -   

	DRUG TASK FORCE
	3440.0000.550.000.03.5080.5080
	 $       15,265.80 

	CRIMINAL JUSTICE/SHERIFF
	3441.0000.550.000.03.5080.5080
	 $         7,632.90 

	CRIME LAB
	3460.0000.100.000.03.5080.5080
	 $         5,456.70 

	911
	3480.0000.100.000.03.5080.5080
	 $       98,380.98 

	CHILD SUPPORT
	3520.0000.260.000.06.5080.5080
	 $     211,988.04 

	VICTIM/WITNESS 1
	3560.3560.220.000.03.5080.5080
	 $         7,487.82 

	FORECLOSURE
	3630.0000.360.000.02.5080.5080
	 $       13,089.60 

	PERSONNEL/BENEFITS
	7000.7000.100.000.12.5080.5080
	 $         5,456.70 

	WORKERS COMP/JONETTE
	7010.0000.100.000.12.5080.5080
	 $         2,176.20 

	SANITARY ENGINEER
	7100.7100.300.304.11.5080.5080
	 $       22,389.84 

	TRANSIT 
	7200.0000.100.000.11.5080.5080
	 $         5,456.70 

	CHILDREN & FAMILY FIRST         
	8100.FY16.100.000.14.5080.5080
	 $         9,083.70 

	CBCF
	8300.0000.660.000.14.5080.5080
	 $       96,930.96 

	TOTAL
	
	 $ 6,537,068.82 


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________
b.4







JOURNAL ENTRY

There were no advances/repayments for this day.

__________________
b.5







RESOULTION NO. 16-404
In the matter of authorizing the purchase of supplies and)

Services for various county departments


)
June 29 2016


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize the purchase of supplies and services for various County departments.

	LOG #
	DEPARTMENT
	FUND
	DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE
	VENDOR
	AMOUNT

	 899 
	Auditor’s
	1000
	Oracle Linux Support 1 yr of Support 
	Oracle America, Inc. 
	        2,035.92 

	 900
	CBCF
	8300
	BPO July-Dec  2016 Cellular Phone Service
	Cellco Partnership 
	           480.00

	 901
	CBCF
	8300
	SBPO July-Dec 2016 Natural Gas Service
	Columbia Gas 
	        8,600.00

	 902
	CBCF
	8300
	SBPO July-Dec 2016 Water/Sewer Service
	Elyria Public Utilities 
	      15,500.00   

	 903
	CBCF
	8300
	SBPO July-Dec 2016 Electric Services
	MidAmerican Energy Co. 
	      14,400.00   

	 904
	CBCF
	8300
	SBPO July-Dec 2016 Electric Delivery Svc. 
	Ohio Edison 
	        6,700.00  

	 905
	CBCF
	8300
	BPO July-Dec 2016 Waste Disposal Svc. 
	Republic Services, Inc. 
	        1,200.00

	 906
	CBCF
	8300 
	BPO July-Dec 2016 Communication Svc. 
	Time Warner Cable 
	        3,180.00

	 907
	CBCF
	8300
	BPO July-Dec 2016 Internet Services
	Windstream Corporation 
	           234.00

	 908
	CBCF
	8300
	BPO July-Dec 2016 Resident Pres./Meds
	Ohliger Drug of N. Olmsted
	        4,500.00

	 909
	CBCF
	8300
	SBPO July-Dec 2016 Food Services
	Aramark Corrections 
	      45,000.00  

	 910
	CBCF
	8300
	BPO July-Dec 2016 Pest Control Services
	Speed Exterminating Co. 
	           420.00

	 911
	CBCF
	8300
	SBPO July-Dec 2016 Managed IT Services
	Great Lakes Computer 
	        5,250.00

	 912
	CBCF
	8300
	SBPO July-Dec 2016 Medical Contract Svc.
	LeMar Medical Services
	      32,300.00

	 913
	Child. & Family
	8100
	Advertising Sponsorship June-August 
	PACE Foundation/WNZN
	        1,000.00

	 914
	Child. & Family 
	8280
	Side by Side “Team Dual” Trike 
	Worksman Trading Corp. 
	        1,959.98

	 915
	Child. & Family
	8240
	Table Cover with Help Me Grow Logo
	Pennylane Printing
	           350.00

	 916
	Domestic Rel. 
	2020
	Success for Youth Program – May 2016
	Catholic Charities 
	         4,420.00

	 917
	Engineer’s
	2580
	Partial Removal of Two-Way Tower 
	Vasu Communications
	         4,664.00

	 918
	Maintenance
	5000
	To Move Crime Lab Equipment 
	Microgenics Corp. 
	         1,500.00

	 919  
	Maintenance
	5000
	To Move Crime Lab Equipment 
	Terra Technologies 
	        4,940.00

	 920
	Solid Waste
	2260
	Replace Wheel Seal, Service Routine 
	Leppo Rents 
	        1,526.80

	 921
	Solid Waste
	2260
	Brown Mulch for Landscaping at Justice Ctr. 
	Liberty Tire Services 
	        3,314.62



Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as. Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________

b.6







RESOLUTION NO. 16-405
In the matter of authorizing Travel Expenses to various)

personnel to attend meetings of interest to their              )

June 29, 2016

departments




           )



BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize travel expenses to various personnel to 

Attending meeting of interest to their departments.

	LOG #
	DEPARTMENT
	NAME
	EVENT
	LOCATION
	DATE
	AMOUNT not
To exceed

	244 
	Solid Waste
	Bailey, Keith 
	2016 WasteCon 
	Indianapolis, IN
	8/21-

8/25/16
	2,046.29



Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





_________________
b.7







RESOLUTION NO. 16-406






APPROVING BILLS FOR PAYMENT


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby approve the following bills for payment, which have been signed by two or more Commissioners:

	VENDOR
	PURPOSE
	ACCOUNT #
	AMOUNT

	General 
	 
	 
	

	Almobayyed, Mona
	Parking Refund
	1000 0000 100 142 01 7070 7089
	$10.00 

	Autobody Products Inc. API
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6000 0000
	$103.35 

	Carter Lumber Co. Ohio Corp.
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6000 0000
	$67.79 

	Center for Individual & Family Services
	Professional Services
	1000 0000 100 142 01 6200 6218
	$1,300.00 

	Cleveland Hearing & Speech Center
	Professional Services
	1000 0000 100 142 01 6200 6218
	$250.00 

	FedEx Grand
	Shipping
	1000 0000 100 106 01 7070 0000
	$18.57 

	Grafton Mower Service
	Equipment
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6050 0000
	$130.13 

	Leonard Interior Supply Inc.
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6000 0000
	$630.48 

	Office Products dba MT Business Technologies
	Copier Lease
	1000 0000 100 100 01 6200 0000
	$166.89 

	Refrigeration Sales
	Equipment
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6050 0000
	$142.44 

	Refrigeration Sales
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6000 0000
	$1.56 

	Reliable Basement & Drain LLC
	High Pressure Water Jetting
	1000 0000 100 108 01 6200 0000
	$375.00 

	Swift First Aid
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6000 0000
	$41.20 

	Time Warner
	Utilities
	1000 0000 100 112 01 6200 6202
	$498.47 

	Time Warner
	Utilities
	1000 0000 100 124 03 6200 6202
	$187.49 

	United Refrigeration Inc.
	Supplies
	1000 0000 100 104 01 6000 0000
	$20.95 

	 
	 
	TOTAL
	$3,944.32 


	Life Insurance
	
	
	

	Reliastar Life Insurance Company
	Life Insurance - May
	1030 0000 100 000 01 5080 5086
	$15,006.75 

	Reliastar Life Insurance Company
	Life Insurance - May
	1030 0000 100 000 01 5080 5086
	$7,893.77 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$22,900.52 

	Community Development
	
	
	

	Ohio Edison
	Utilities
	2061 2063 100 116 07 6200 0000
	$12.11 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$12.11 

	Dog Kennel 
	
	
	

	Cintas Corporation 
	Uniform Rental 
	2220 0000 100 000 05 6600 6602
	$47.05 

	Cintas Corporation 
	Mat Rental 
	2220 0000 100 000 05 6600 6603
	$32.24 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$79.29 

	Law Library
	
	
	

	The Legal Aid Society of Cleveland
	Law Books
	3110 0000 650 000 02 6000 6011
	$105.00 

	Matthew Bender & Co., Inc.
	Law Books
	3110 0000 650 000 02 6000 6011
	$731.56 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$836.56 

	Golden Acres
	
	
	

	AA Fire Protection LLC
	Building Maintenance
	3424 0000 100 000 05 6380 6381
	$1,156.00 

	Columbia Gas of Ohio
	Utilities
	3424 0000 100 000 05 6200 6202
	$27.16 

	Ohio Edison
	Utilities
	3424 0000 100 000 05 6200 6202
	$2,312.79 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$3,495.95 

	Sanitary Engineer
	
	
	

	Raeburn, Raymond dba Ray's Concrete Inc.
	Repairs/Maintenance
	7100 7100 300 304 11 6380 0000
	$900.00 

	Sandusky Electric, Inc.
	Supplies
	7100 7100 300 304 11 6000 0000
	$375.00 

	The Superprinter, LTD
	Printing/Advertising
	7100 7100 300 304 11 7220 0000
	$261.22 

	Treasurer of State Ohio Public Utilities Commission
	Fees-Damage Prevention 
	7100 7100 300 300 11 7000 0000
	$25.00 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$1,561.22 

	Transit
	
	
	

	Timms, Danielle
	Deposit Refund
	7200 7200 100 150 11 7070 7089
	$500.00 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$500.00 

	Airport
	
	
	

	Chronicle Telegram
	Advertising
	7300 0000 100 000 11 7220 0000
	$420.57 

	MRK Aviation, Inc
	Repairs/Maintenance
	7300 0000 100 000 11 6380 0000
	$750.00 

	Ohio Edison
	Utilities
	7300 0000 100 000 11 6200 6202
	$802.68 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$1,973.25 

	CFFC
	
	
	

	Friends Service Co Inc dba Friends Office
	Supplies
	8100 FY16 100 000 14 6000 0000
	$188.65 

	Office Products dba MT Business Technologies
	Supplies
	8100 FY16 100 000 14 6000 0000
	$127.17 

	
	
	TOTAL
	$315.82 



Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





_________________

b.8







JOURNAL ENTRY


Commissioner Lundy requested an executive session to discuss personnel resignation at Community Development, appointments at Keep Lorain County Beautiful, ADAS and Mental Health.
________________

 b.9







RESOLUTION NO. 16-407
In the matter of approving & waiving the reading of the     )

same for the Lorain County Board of Commissioners         )
June 29 2016

meeting minutes of June 15 & 22, 2016


   ) 


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby approve & waive the reading of the same for the Lorain County Board of Commissioners meeting minutes.

For June 15 & 22, 2016


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________

b/10







RESOLUTION NO. 16-408

In the matter of amending Resolution No.16-333, adopted )
June 1, 2016 awarding the 2016 Roof Replacement/Repair )

Contracts





    )
June 29, 2016


WHEREAS, bid were received and opened on Thursday, May 12, 2016 for the 2016 Roof Replacement / Repair projects as follows:

LOCATION

CRM

ABSOLUTE

WEATHERTIGHT

SIBLEY

374 Broad Street
150,845
  
97,800


150,860



139,235

Alt. 1


   9,630
  
11,800*


 (1200 per skylight)

 12,670

Gateway Blvd.

Records Center

No bid

 57,200


 70,495



 62,255

1064/1080 Infirmary

Juvenile Pods

No bid

 45,000

 
59,645



 62,485

Repairs:

322 N. Gateway

No bid

 4,500


 7,500



  6,000

42110 Russia Rd.
No bid

 5,000 


 5,000



  3,500

45999 N. Ridge Rd
No bid

80,000


10,000



  9,500

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we do and hereby award a contract to Absolute Roofing and Construction, Inc., Cleveland, Ohio in the amount of Two Hundred Twenty-one Thousand Three Hundred Dollars.  This contract includes roof replacements for 374 Broad Street including Alternate No. 1, Records Center, Juvenile Pods, and the repairs at 322 N. Gateway and 42110 Russia Road.  Funds are available from capital improvement accounts based on location and project.  

FURTHER BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we do and hereby award a contract to Weathertight Construction, LaGrange, Ohio for the repairs at 45999 N. Ridge Road.  Weathertight was available to perform the repairs within the timeframe allotted.


BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that we do and hereby issue a Notice to Proceed effective on or before June 13, 2016.  


FURTHER BE IT RESOLVED, the County Administrator is hereby granted the authority to notify the County Auditor to release retainage at the completion of the contract.

NOW, BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, said bid was the lowest and most responsive bids received complying with specifications.


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________









CHILDREN & FAMILIES COUNCIL

B.11







RESOLUTION NO. 16-409
In the matter of approving & entering into a Purchase of Service)

contract on behalf of Children Family Council with Cleveland   )

Hearing & Speech Center for the Help Me Grow Program for    )
       June 29, 2016

sign language interpretation grant for Fiscal Year 2017               )   







BE IT RESOLVED by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby approve & enter into a Purchase of Service Contract on behalf of Children & Family Council with Cleveland Hearing and Speech Center for the Fiscal Year 2017.  Said contract can be found in the Commissioners/Purchasing Department and at Children & Family Council’s Offices.

1)
Cleveland Hearing and Speech Center 


$500.00


FURTHER BE IT RESOLVED said monies are available from the Help Me Grow grant and contract will be in effect from July 1, 2016 through June 30, 2017 and authorize said payments to be made within said contracts.


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________
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RESOLUTION NO. 16-410
In the matter of approving contracts for Fiscal Year 2017 )

Help Me Grow Program for Part C Service Coordination,)   
June 29, 2016

Evaluation, and Therapy Consultation


)




BE IT RESOLVED by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby approve the contracts for the fiscal year 2017 Help Me Grow Program Part C Early Intervention.


FURTHER BE IT RESOLVED said contracts are considered a part hereof to this resolution by reference thereto and can be found on file in the commissioners Purchasing Office/Children and Families Council, effective July 1, 2016 thru June 30, 2017 and authorize said payments to be made within said contracts listed below:


1)
Children’s Developmental Center

$10,660.00




Services: Therapy Consultation:  OT, PT, and Speech


2)
Neighborhood Alliance 


$519,140.00




Services:  Service Coordination & Evaluations


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________









COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
b.13







RESOLUTION NO. 16-411

In the matter of awarding a contract to Concrete & More, Inc.  )

Avon Lake, in amount of $4,620 for Eleanor St. John to receive)
June 29, 2016

grant assistance from CHIP PY14 Home Repair activity            )

WHEREAS, Lorain County has received funding for home repairs in Program Year 2014 Community Housing and Impact Preservation (CHIP) funds from the Ohio Development Services Agency to provide assistance to low and moderate income families in accordance with the grant agreement, and 

WHEREAS, the property owner has applied for assistance and been determined eligible for a grant, and Concrete & More, Inc. 168 Fairfield Rd., Avon Lake, Ohio in the amount of $4,200.00 with a contingency of $420.00 for a total of $4,620.00 for Eleanor St. John, 114 Moorewood, Avon Lake, Ohio, (Parcel ID #04-00-007-107-045) for storm/sanitary lateral separation, this being the best and most responsive. 

Said payments will be paid from Acct #2660.2662.100.120.07.6200.0000 Ohio Housing CDBG account.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that this resolution stand as authorization to pay invoices and the Lorain County Commissioners hereby authorize payment of such amounts upon completion and acceptance of the contracts. 


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________









JOB AND FAMILY SERVICES

b.14







RESOLUTION NO. 16-412

In the matter of advertising request for sealed bids for non-  )

emergency medical transportation for Job & Family Services)
June 29, 2016              


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby request to advertise for sealed bids for non-emergency medical transportation for Job & Family Services.


Notice to be in The Chronicle-Telegram on July 11th  & 18th, bids to be opened immediately following the 2:00 p.m. deadline on July 25, 2016 in Meeting Room D.

BID REQUEST FOR SEALED BIDS

NON-EMERGENCY MEDICAL TRANSPORTATION

Sealed bids will be received until 2:00 p.m. on Monday, July 25, 2016 by the Lorain County Commissioners, Lorain County Administration Building, Purchasing Department, 226 Middle Avenue, Elyria, Ohio 44035, for 

non-emergency medical transportation (NET) for residents of Lorain County.

The above requested service will be used by Lorain County Department of Job and Family Services, in accordance with specification.  Bids will be opened immediately following the 2:00 p.m. deadline in the Lorain County Commissioners Fourth Floor Public Meeting Room.

Bid packets for this service will be available beginning Monday, July 11, 2016 at the Lorain County Purchasing Department, 226 Middle Avenue, Fourth Floor, Elyria, Ohio 44035. You may obtain a packet in one of the following ways:

1.
Pick up at Lorain County Purchasing Department.

2.
Request in writing for a packet to be e-mailed.  Send the e-mail request to KC Saunders, ksaunders@loraincounty.us , at the Lorain County Purchasing Department.

3.
Request in writing via the US Postal Service for Lorain County Purchasing Department to mail a packet.

Each bid shall contain the full name or names of the person and company submitting the RFB and shall be enclosed in a preprinted 
envelope supplied by the county and marked “RFB - Non-Emergency Medical Transportation”.

The Board of Commissioners reserves the right to reject any and all bids and to waive any informalities or irregularities if it is deemed in the best interest of Lorain County to do so.  Any interpretation, correction, or modifications to the specifications desired shall be submitted in writing to Kristin Whiteman, Contract Supervisor, Lorain County Department of Job and Family Services, 42485 North Ridge Road, Elyria, Ohio 44035, e-mail: Kristin.Whiteman@jfs.ohio.gov , fax #440.323.3422, and must be received at least four (4) days prior to the date of the bid opening.

Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________









CLERK OF COURTS

B.15







JOURNAL ENTRY

In the matter of advertising for sealed proposals for Courts )

Case Management System



   )
June 29, 2016


Clerk of Courts Orlando said this is the process to get bids for the courts case management system. Vendors will have 5 weeks to submit being that it is an intense process with 5 divisions involved and then a mandatory meeting on July 25 at the Justice Center Jury Room for FAQ, then on August 8 at 2 pm in meeting room d, bids will be opened.  Within the specs there is 180 days for review. All bids will be put in a scoring system and will give demonstrations. 

Commissioner Kalo asked if the documents were as big as Lucas County. Clerk of Courts Orlando said around 400+ pages, not as big. Commissioner Kalo asked if it will be 1 vendor for all 5 divisions. Clerk of Courts Orlando said hopefully this is the case.  He just attended the Clerk Association meeting and many vendors were there waiting for the information to be released, we are the 9th largest county and it is nice to see that the whole justice system is on board and invested.

Assistant County Prosecutor Innes said also within the specs are alternates, but hope that one vendor can do all but everything needs to be integrated/interfaced the same way.

Commissioner Kalo said this is a significant expense, he understands the need but it’s a huge costs.

Commissioner Lundy said the need is there but couldn’t come at the worst time with the county’s finances and would hope that the justice system will be on board to bring in additional revenue to the county, finances are bad and the county has a lot of debt service

Commissioner Kokoski said it sounds like there is a good process/plan in place by all involved but needs to be cost effective.

Clerk of Court Orlando said they are doing the work in house, so that is a cost savings, when he asked his Chief Deputy Alisa Lieux to do this, she said, “she is not familiar with other court managements system, only the one they have”, he said good that means a clean start and no bias.


Discussion continued and the following resolution was adopted:

B.15







RESOLUTION NO. 16-413

In the matter of advertising for sealed proposals for Courts )

Case Management System



   )
June 29, 2016


BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby advertise for sealed proposals for Courts Case Management System.


Notice to be Chronicle Telegram on July 5 & 12, 2016, mandatory pre-bid meeting on July 25 and open at 2 pm on August 8

NOTICE TO VENDORS

1.
Sealed proposals will be received by the Board of Commissioners for Lorain County, Ohio at the office of the Purchasing Department, 4th Floor, Lorain County Administration Building 226 Middle Avenue, Elyria, Ohio 44035 for the furnishing of all services, materials, equipment, programming including software, hardware and support services for the installation and operation for the “Lorain County Courts Case Management System”.

2.
Such sealed proposals will be accepted until 2:00 P.M. on August 8, 2016.  Proposals may be submitted between the hours of 8:00 A.M. to 4:00 P.M., Mondays through Fridays.

3.
Such proposals must be in strict conformity with contract documents, plans and specifications which may be obtained at the Purchasing Department offices, during the same hours available for submitting proposals. 

4.
2 original copies and 3 DVD’s of each proposal must be included and must contain the name of the person or company submitting the proposal and shall be enclosed in a sealed envelope marked “Lorain County Courts Case Management System Proposal”.

5.
A Mandatory pre-proposal conference will be held on July 25, 2016 at the Lorain County Justice Center from 1:00 P.M. to 4:00 P.M..  Questions and registration for the conference must be received no later than 12:00 P.M. on July 15, 2016.

6.
Proposals will be opened and read upon expiration of the time for filing proposals, on August 8, 2016 immediately following the deadline of 2:00 P.M in Meeting Room D, 4th 
Floor, Lorain County Administration Building 226 Middle Avenue, Elyria, Ohio 44035. 

7.
The award will be granted based upon evaluation and negotiation pursuant to Section 307.862 of the Revised Code. The Board of Commissioners reserves the right to reject any and all bids and to waive any informalities or irregularities.


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________(discussion was held on the above)








ENGINEER
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RESOLUTION NO. 16-414

In the matter of entering into a lease purchase with Akron )

Tractor & Equipment & Kansas State Bank for a New       )
June 29, 2016

Holland T4-75 Tractor with side and rear Alamo mowers  )

for County Garage in amount of $66,713.90 

   )

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby enter into a lease purchase with Akron Tractor & Equipment & Kansas State Bank for a New Holland T4-75 Tractor with side and rear Alamo mowers for County Garage in amount of $66,713.90.

FURTHER BE IT RESOLVED, said agreement is considered a part hereof to this resolution by reference thereto and can be found on file in the Commissioners/Purchasing & Engineers Office and we hereby authorize said payment to be made from Acct#mvgt


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________









SHERIFF
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RESOLUTION NO. 16-415

In the matter of approving an addendum to Secures )

Technologies for inmate phone service at the jail     )

June 29, 2016

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby approve an addendum to Secures Technologies for inmate phone service at the jail.

FURTHER BE IT RESOLVED, the addendum is to reflect some increase due to changes in some federal regulations and can be found on file in the Commissioners/Purchasing & Sheriff’s Office.


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.

Motion carried.





__________________









JOURNAL ENTRY


Elaine Georgas, Executive Director – Lorain County Alcohol & Drug Addiction Services thanked the Commissioners for this opportunity and the appointments they make to this board.

Late yesterday, Clerk Upton sent her the valuation from Auditors office on the levy request of 1 mill, 1.2 mill and 1.5 mill for either 5 or 10 years so the board will meet to determine a resolution to take to the ballot.


ADAS said they have been staying ahead of the heroin/opiate epidemic, they placed ads in the paper and have been flooded with calls.  They are the last stand alone ADAS board in the state of Ohio and they do work closely with the Mental Health Board.
She stated ADAS was created in 1989 via Ohio Legislation – ORC 340. Commissioners voted to create a separate, stand-alone board to address substance abuse prevention and treatment services for Lorain County’s residents and there are 18 members (volunteer) – 12 appointed by Commissioners, 6 appointed by Ohio Mental Health and Addiction Services.

Over 25 years Solely reliant on ever-shrinking state and federal budgets.  The sole – specific – expertise is recognized locally, statewide and nationally for our focus on substance abuse treatment, prevention and recovery focus and most recently, the “content experts in Ohio” regarding opiate/heroin addiction solutions.
ADAS is; 

· 1 of 3 in the nation $5.6 mil (4 year) grant for Recovery Resiliency Grant (City of Lorain); 

· 1 of 697 communities in the nation supported for a 10-year Drug Free Communities and Support Program – through the Office of National Drug Control Program – the White House

· Assisted in Lorain County as the successful pilot for Narcan for first responders

· Leads Ohio’s behavioral health authorities for a Recovery Oriented System of Care  Transformation

· With ADAS’ assistance, Elyria is 1 of 3 communities (in Ohio)who have toughened their social host ordinances charging adults with neglect for providing alcohol to minors

· Partner with LCCC and The LCADA Way to open the CARE Center (main campus at LCCC) 

ADAS partners with;

· ADAS, as part of the Lorain County Health Improvement Plan – coordinates the goal: to reduce deaths due to overdose from opiates/heroin

· ADAS is represented locally on: Children and Families Council, Reentry Coalition, Community Corrections Act Board, Child Fatality Review, Integrated Services Partnership, Healthy Kids Achieve More Network, Lorain County Prevention Connection. 

· Serves as fiscal agent to:  Lorain County’s Drug Free Community Coalition (Communities That Care of Lorain County) and the Lorain County Fatherhood Collaborative 

ADAS has service providers for residents;

· Big Brothers Big Sisters of Lorain County - prevention

· Fireland’s Counseling & Recovery Services - treatment

· The LCADA Way – prevention & treatment

· Let’s Get Real- peer supports

· Lorain UMADAOP - prevention

· New Directions - treatment

· ORCA House - treatment

· Stella Maris – treatment

· Communities That Care of Lorain County- drug-free community coalition 

Need for Services is Illuminated in the Board’s Strategic Plan to Secure Financial Resources

·  Currently serving approximately 2,300 clients annually for substance abuse treatment, which is 10% of residents with Alcohol and Other Drug Disorder

· Investing in school based, individual and community based prevention with 14 public school districts and communities

· Addressing the impact of substance abuse and addiction with other systems:  Criminal Justice, Child Welfare, Healthcare, Employers – Workforce

Mrs. Georgas, said Addiction is a Chronic Disease,  just like heart disease, diabetes and cancer, all of which may be fatal if left 
untreated.  People of all ages, classes and ethnic backgrounds can get addiction. According to Nora Volkow, MD ,Director, National Institute on Drug Abuse, “Drug addiction is a chronic disease, drugs change the brain.  Physically changes it.  And these changes are very long lasting and persist for a long period of time after the person stops taking the drug.”

The costs of excessive drinking results from losses in workplace productivity (72% of the total cost), health care expenses for problems caused by excessive drinking (11% of total), law enforcement and other criminal justice expenses related to excessive alcohol consumption (9% of total), and motor vehicle crash costs from impaired driving (6% of the total) .(National  Center for Chronic Disease and Health Promotion) 


There are affects in the workplace with substance abusers;

· are 1/3 less productive than non-abusers

· are 10 times more likely to miss work than non-abusers

· use 300-400% more medical benefits

· are responsible for 50-80% of workplace shrinkage and theft

· have 3.6 times more accidents on the job, and 5 times more off

· file 51% of all workers’ compensation claims
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733 = 49,000 people in Lorain County and the doctors/hospitals have started to take the pain level out of their questions.
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Needing but not Receiving Treatment for Illicit Drug or Alcohol 

Problems.  According to the 2014 National Survey on Drug Use and 

Health, Ohio’s estimates for persons needing but not receiving 

treatment for Illicit Drug Use, Alcohol Use and Past Year meeting 

criteria for Illicit Drug Dependence or Abuse and Alcohol Dependence 

or Abuse for persons age 18 and older and those age 12-17 equates 

to: 

Population (Lorain 

County)

Census 

(approximated)

Needing but Not Receiving Treatment Meeting criteria for      Dependence or 

Abuse

Illicit Drug Use                               

(%, #)

Alcohol Use (%,#) Illicit Drug 

Dependence or Abuse 

(%, #)

Alcohol 

Dependence or 

Abuse (%, #)

Age 12-17 35,000 2.9%, 1,015 2.59%, 906 3.05%, 1,067 2.74%, 959

Age 18+ 229,276 10.44%, 23,936 25.16%, 57,685 11.94%, 27,375 38.09%, 87,331



Ms. Georgas said outcomes/prevention in the last 24 months (July 1, 2013 – June 30, 2015)
· 253 adolescents MATCHED with a Mentor 

· 40 adolescents increased involvement in afterschool Alcohol, Tobacco and Other (ATOD) drug-free activities

· 143 parents identified that they will provide clear and consistent expectations of non-use ATOD, and rules and consequences for ATOD use

· 219 adolescents perceived ATOD use as unacceptable risks for him/herself

· 308 preschoolers showing positive improvement in daycare programming (summer)

· 6,235 students in grades 5-10 reporting being free from alcohol (including smokeless tobacco) and other drugs (including recreational use of prescription medications) for the past 30-days

· 6 school districts have implemented drug testing policies for their students

· 1 local community toughened their Social Host Ordinance

· 3,180 POUNDS of pills were dropped off at April, 2016’s Drug Takeback in Lorain county (in addition – 2,000 lbs. of pills were dropped off at October, 2015’s Drug Takeback) – WE OFFER MEDSAFES!

· 650 Students from 11 school districts participate in the “We are the Majority Rally” (each year) – proclaiming themselves DRUGFREE!!

· Work with local police departments for underage drinking – compliance checks (fall ‘2014 – 18 citations out of 79 retailers) 

Treatment outcomes for the same time frame;

· 12 adolescents achieved abstinence, engaged in supportive relationships and/or incurred no legal charges

· 47 adolescents connected with and participated in at least one community support agency/activity and is abstinent at discharge

· 46 adults received detoxification series and committed to their next level of treatment

· 177 women received substance abuse treatment, including family treatment, parenting, trauma focused, and were abstinent at discharge

· 351 men received substance abuse treatment, showing demonstrated ability to sustain abstinence, and actively working relapse plan.

· 30 adults received ambulatory detox (service began July, 2015)

There are several other approaches to get residents healthy;

· Lorain County included in Ohio’s Access to Recovery Grant (IV) – to provide peer supports,  recovery housing, gap assistance (drivers’ license, gym memberships – limited), employment skills, daily living/life-skills  - with non-traditional treatment providers

· Partner with Specialty Docket:  Family Drug Court, Juvenile Drug Court, Recovery Court
Commissioner Kokoski asked about Veterans Court, Ms. Georgas said they have been working on that but not fully there yet.
· United Way collaborative – Common View – Midview and Clearview Schools

· Healthy Kids Achieve More – in partnership with County Health, Mental Health, Educational Services Center

· Project DAWN of Lorain County

· Modified Police Assisted Addiction Recovery Initiative

· SOLACE – Family Support 
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Commissioner Kokoski asked if there are numbers on overdoses without deaths.  Ms. Georgas said they receive reports from law enforcement when Narcon is used but trying to get reports from hospitals.  Commissioner Kokoski said that would be a number to see.
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Ms. Georgas said the power of prevention 

· 9 out of 10 people with substance abuse problems started using by age 18

· Every 25 minutes, a baby is born in the United States suffering from Opioid Withdrawal  Newborns with Neonatal Abstinence Syndrome (NAS) stay in hospitals at birth 16.9 days, costing $66,700 vs. newborns without NAS staying 2.1 days, costing $3,500

· Multiple studies indicate that every dollar spent on substance abuse prevention results in an average of $10 in long term savings 
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They have also received a grant for binge drinking, which has always been an issue.
· Lorain County has not had a publicly funded detox for their residents since 1997

· New Medications (and guidelines from the American Society of Addiction Medicine) are proving to be effective in combating opiate addiction

· Recovery Supports (including sober living, peers) are proving effective in combating addiction

Opiate Addiction;

· Overdose deaths continue to be in the 60+ since 2013 

· Based on this, Center for Disease Control determines approximately 1,000 Lorain County adults are in need of substance addiction treatment (specific for opiate/heroin addiction)

· Relapse Prevention, Sober Supports, and Medication Assisted Treatment – effective for success

· Complete Continuum of Care inclusive of detox, residential, intensive outpatient, recovery support (including housing, peers)

· Mandate to counties, effective 07/01/17

· Fiduciary responsibility to serve our residents

The services need to continue;

· To provide detox to 750 individuals – we need access to 11 detox beds

· To provide residential inpatient treatment – we need access to 66 beds to serve 400 individuals

· To start the road to sobriety – we need to cover up to 4 months of sober housing

· Expansion  - More Peer Supporters throughout a person’s recovery journey (support to get into detox, through treatment and develop/support their recovery plan)

Commissioner Lundy said he is not sure that taxpayers understand how expensive this is at $225/day and a lot of our jails are picking up 

this tab.

Commissioner Kokoski asked if the vivitrol shot is being administered when inmates are released.  Ms. Georgas said not yet, there are 

some issues that need to be discussed but have a meeting this Friday, also the shot cost $1,100

Commissioner Kokoski said she is involved in Stepping Up Initiative and this is one thing the major jails are doing and has a meeting 

coming up to discuss these very issues that you have discussed today.
[image: image11.emf]
Ms. Georgas said the total need for services is $7.203 million/year and the valuation from the Auditor is

1 mill = $6.511 million

1.2 mill = $7.8133 million

1.5 mill = $9.766 million
Commissioner Lundy said the taxpayers don’t think they need to help people with these services and give more money to staffing. Ms. Georgas said they are housed in a donated building, have a lean staff and the money will be used for planning, services, prevention and support. Just like it was mentioned early a lot of people go to jail to get the help they need and the taxpayers are paying for this.

Commissioner Kokoski said we need to get people help and support and get them back to a healthy real life


Commissioners thanked her for presenting this information__________________(discussion was held on the above)

c.







COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR

June 29, 2016




Mr. Cordes was on vacation



____________________
d.







ASSISTANT COUNTY PROSECUTOR


Mr. Gerald Innes requested an executive session to discuss 2 pending court actions.

____________________
e.







COMMISSIONERS REPORT



Commissioner Kokoski said Thursday she has a Stepping Up Initiative meeting at the Transportation Center and has received a good response from the police chiefs and we need to help the mental/drug addiction, it cost around $100+/day to stay in jail.
Commissioner Kokoski attended the International Festival parade, very nice, but hot.  She ran into Kathy aka “Voltage” and they did not receive a grant from Buckeye Council but will do a pilot program in Lorain Schools “healthy body-healthy mind”.  She is also looking for donations to give rewards such as excursion to islands, zipline at common ground, etc “24 grams in 24 hours”.
Commissioner Kokoski said the Dems had a cookout on Monday and it was good and spoke with Assistant Prosecutor Chris Pyanowski and he hit is mark of collecting $5 million in delinquent taxes, great job. Commissioner Kalo said congrats to Treasurer Talarek as well.

Commissioner Kalo congratulated the International Festival on their 50th anniversary
Commissioner Kalo said July 13 at LCCC is the Best of Lorain County

Commissioner Kalo wished everyone a Happy & Safe 4th of July.

Commissioner Lundy said the International parade was fun.
Commissioner Lundy attended the rally MOVE had and stated that the Commissioners support transit and the hearings will be coming up

Commissioner Lundy thanked NOACA and waiting on the information for the $100,000 grant received for Transit and $80,000 for lakefront communities





________________(discussion was held on the above)
f.







CLERK’S REPORT




#1.
County Offices will be closed Monday, July 4 in observance of 4th of July








​_________________

g.







BOARD CORRESPONDENCE



Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to approve the Board Correspondence and waive the reading of the same.  Ayes: All.

Motion carried.

#1.
US Army Corps of Engineers public notice Nationwide permit reissuance requirements for comments

#2.
USPS builder developer information packet for use and installation of cluster box units (cc: LCCDD)

#3.
Commissioner Lundy executed 2nd installment of grant award for CFFC

#4.
July 13 from 6-9 at LCCC Spitzer – Best of Lorain County 2016 pulse. Tickets at www.pulselorainmag.com/bestofloraincounty2016
#5.
August 11-12, 2016 – Ohio Charter School Summit, Columbus, Register at https://resweb.passkey.com/go/OHAUDIT2016
#6.
Commissioners send a letter of support of Office on Aging for grant from Community Foundation

#7.
Publications: “Ohio Turnpike Customer connection”; “Equal Opportunity”; “CCAO statehouse reports”; “Counties Count”

#8.
Columbia Gas of Ohio, Inc., filed on June 14, 2016 Center Ridge road mandatory relocation project in N. Ridgeville,  This has been re-filed and new case #16-1420-GA-BNR


_________________
h.







PUBLIC COMMENT 










(Please limit your comments to three minutes)

There was no public comment for this day.

________________
JOURNAL ENTRY




Commissioner Lundy moved, seconded by Kalo to go into an executive session at 10:40 a.m. to discuss personnel resignation at Community Development, appointments at Keep Lorain County Beautiful, ADAS and Mental Health and pending court actions.  Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: all.
Motion carried.





_________________
Commissioners reconvened from executive session and the following resolution was adopted:







RESOLUTION NO. 16-416
In the matter of authorizing various personnel actions)

As indicated on the summary sheet for employees      )

Within the jurisdiction of the Lorain County Board    )

Of Commissioners



       )

June 29, 2016

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lorain County Board of Commissioners that we hereby authorize various personnel actions as indicated on the summary sheet for employees within the jurisdiction of the Lorain County Board of Commissioners.

Community Development:
Resignations;

1.
Mona Almobayyed, Economic Development Specialist, effective June 27, 2016 at rate of $17.00/hour

Appointments:

Keep Lorain County Beautiful;

1.
Erica Larson, effective June 29, 2016 – December 31, 2017 filling unexpired term of Rita George

Re-appointments;

Alcohol & Drug Addiction Services Board, effective July 1, 2016 – June 30, 2020

1.
Deborah Raesler

2.
Rev Bradley Donahue

3.
James Schaeper

4.
Sarah Malik

Appointments;

Mental Health Board;

1.
Chad Burnworth, effective July 1, 2016 – June 30, 2020


Motion by Lundy, seconded by Kalo to adopt Resolution. Upon roll call the vote taken thereon, resulted as: Ayes: All.

Motion carried.





__________________








JOURNAL ENTRY






With no further business before the Board, Motion by Lundy seconded by Kalo to adjourn at 11:20 a.m. Ayes: All

Motion carried.

The meeting then adjourned.








_____________________________________________)Commissioners








Matt Lundy, President



            )














            )







__________________________________________    _)of








Ted Kalo, Vice-president


            )














            )








_____________________________________________)Lorain County








Lori Kokoski, Member



            )Ohio

Attest:________________________________, Clerk

Theresa L. Upton
Please note that the Commissioners’ meetings are open to the public.  The scheduled air times for the meetings will be shown on Saturday at 12:00 Noon and Monday at 11:00 p.m. subject to change at the discretion of the Lorain County Community College.  The meetings might be also broadcasted in additional time periods as scheduling permits.  If anyone wants to purchase a copy of the  Commissioners Meeting Tapes, please call Lorain County Records Center at 440-326-4866.
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ABUSE OF PRESCRIPTION PAIN MEDICATIONS
Risks HEROIN UsE

In 2010 almost 1 in 20 adolescents and adults - 12 million people - used prescription pain
medication when it was not prescribed for them or only for the feeling it caused . While many
believe these drugs are not dangerous because they can be prescribed by a doctor, abuse
often leads to dependence. And eventually, for some, pain medication abuse leads to heroin.
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PEOPLE WHO TAKE NON MEDICAL
PRESCRIPTION PAIN RELIEVERS WILLTRY
HEROIN WITHIN 10 YEARS

Heroin users are 3X as likely

to be dependent

14% of non medical prescription
pain reliever users are dependent

) % 54% of herain users are dependent*

Heroin Emergency Room
Admissions Are Increasing®

1.4 million and the
problem is
getting
worse. . .
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When it comes to

most youth deserve an 1 ;

levatioh Wor

underage drinking,

MOST YOUNG PEOPLE

®~ DON'T USE

® ALCOHOL.
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Underage drinking
rates are going down.
Rates of current, binge, and
heavy drinking by 12- to 20-

year-olds have been declining
for more than a decade.’ Among
8th to 12th graders, rates of
current and binge drinking have
reached the lowest point since
the mid-1990s or longer.?

*http://www.samhsa.gov/data/NSDUH/2012SummNatFindDetTables/NationalFindings/

NSDUHresults2012.htm#ch3.2

“http:/ /www.monitoringthefuture.org// pubs/monographs/ mtf-overview2012. pdf

Less than one fourth of 12- to 20-year-olds
reported drinking alcohol in the past month.!

RISK

More high school students understand that binge
drinking carries great risk of physical or other harm
and most disapprove of weekend binge drinking.?

YOUTH ARE WAITING
LONGER TO START DRINKING.
In 2002, the average age of first
alcohol use among those younger
than age 21 was 15.5 years. In 2012,
the average age was 16 years.'

Fewer youth are drinking

and then driving.

The number of teens ages 16
and older who drive while
impaired has dropped by
more than half —54%—since
6114
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. samhsa.gov un sAuleA 7 (1-877-728-4727)

2 http://www.monitoringthefuture.org// pressreleases/ 13drugpr_complete.pdf
“http:/ /www.cdc.gov/mmwr/preview/mmwrhtml/mm6139a5.htm?s_cid=mm6139a5_w
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CONVERSATION

1 FACTS you didn’t Mﬁwfﬁr
KNOW ABOUT DRUGS .19
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¥ ' non medical reasons

28360 Sammea o
138
é“’ %l 9 0UT OF 10 PEOPLE gy g it Al
- B i I IH

£ STARTED USING
¥ =" ByAGE18 ”'M'ﬂ‘
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of the World's Population and PAIN
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ADDlCTION that4 Outof §

is a chronic disease, o s lsers
just like heart dissase, diabetes °
and cancer, all of which may be Start Out with

Jfatal if left untreated  Preseition g

If someone in your family has a
problem with substance use, it puts
you at greater risk for a problem
with alcohol and other drugs














Lorain County continues to be in the top counties in Ohio for Drug Poisoning Deaths
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Lorain County continues tobe inthe top
courties in Ohiofor Drug Poisoning Deats












Overdose Deaths - Lorain County (sources: Ohio Department of Health and Lorain County Coroner's Office) 2006-2015

Overdose Deaths - Lorain County (sources: Ohio Department of Health and Lorain County Coroner's Office) 2006-2015	2006	2007	2008	2009	2010	2011	2012	2013	2014	2015	18	16	18	25	25	22	61	67	65	65	Microsoft_Office_Excel_2007_Workbook1.xlsx

Sheet1


												Lorain Couty Accidental Overdose Deaths


												Year			Overdose Deaths - Lorain County (sources: Ohio Department of Health and Lorain County Coroner's Office) 2006-2015


												2006			18


												2007			16


												2008			18


												2009			25


												2010			25


												2011			22


												2012			61


												2013			67


												2014			65


												2015			65
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Needing but not Receiving Treatment for Illicit Drug or Alcohol Problems.  According to the 2014 National Survey on Drug Use and Health, Ohio’s estimates for persons needing but not receiving treatment for Illicit Drug Use, Alcohol Use and Past Year meeting criteria for Illicit Drug Dependence or Abuse and Alcohol Dependence or Abuse for persons age 18 and older and those age 12-17 equates to: 

		 
 
Population (Lorain County)		 
 
Census (approximated)		Needing but Not Receiving Treatment				Meeting criteria for      Dependence or Abuse		

						Illicit Drug Use                               (%, #)
 		Alcohol Use (%,#)		Illicit Drug Dependence or Abuse (%, #)		Alcohol Dependence or Abuse (%, #)

		Age 12-17		35,000		2.9%, 1,015		2.59%, 906		3.05%, 1,067		2.74%, 959

		Age 18+		229,276		10.44%, 23,936		25.16%, 57,685		11.94%, 27,375		38.09%, 87,331














