
COUNTY OF LORAIN BID TABULATION SHEET 

 
BID FOR:  _2016 Roof Replacement/Repair Projects _ 

 

DATE OF OPENING: _May 13, 2016 @ 2:00pm _ 
 

 

 

 

BIDDERS 
C.R.M., Inc. Weathertight 

Construction 

Absolute 

Roofing 

Sibley, Inc 
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374 Broad St 150,845.00 150,860.00 97,800.00 139,235.00 

Metal Deck  

Replacement (sqft) 

8.50 5.50 6.00 9.00 

Alternate #1 Skylight 

Replacement 

9,630.00 750-Skyligh 

200-OSHA Fall Prot. 

450-Curbt 

No Bid 12,670.00 

3,320.00-OSHA 

Safety Cage 

320 N. Gateway Blvd. No Bid 70,495.00 57,200.00 62,255.00 

 

Wet Insulation 

Replacement (sqft) 

No Bid 2.00-2" 

2.50-3" 

20.00 3.00 

Wood Nailer 

Replacement  

(linear ft) 

No Bid 4.00-2"x6" 

7.50-2"x12" 

2.00 3.00 

Concrete Deck 

Replacement (sqft) 

No Bid 150 28.00 25.00 

Steel Deck  

Replacement (sqft) 

No Bid 5.50 6.00 9.00 

1064/1080  

Infirmary Rd 

No Bid 59,645.00 45,000.00 62,485.00 

Total No Bid 281,000.00 200,000.00 263,975.00 

Discount if  

Awarded All 3 

No Bid 2,500.00 6,000.00 5,000.00 

New Total No Bid 278,500.00 194,000.00 258,975.00 

Repairs No Bid 75.00 45.00 80.00 

320 N. Gateway  

Est. Price 

No Bid 7,500.00 5,000.00 6,000.00 

42110 Russia Rd  

Est. Price 

No Bid 5,000.00 4,000.00 3,500.00 

45999 N. Ridge Rd 

Est. Price 

No Bid 10,000.00 80,000.00 9,500.00 


