



BID TABULATION SHEET

Project Title: Lorain County Public Health - New Facility

Project No: BPA # 17-38

Bid Date: 10/9/2018

Bid Time: 2:00pm

Bids Opened by: _____

Bids Recorded by: _____

	Company Name Representative Address Phone E-mail	<i>Hubbard Construction Group</i>	<i>Veterans Contracting</i>	<i>Sina Construction</i>	<i>John G. Johnson Construction</i>	<i>Rylen Construction</i>	<i>Stutz Builders</i>	<i>Lucas Plumbing & Heating</i>
Addenda (# R01) Acknowledged	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
Bid Form, Properly Signed	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
Bid Guaranty / Contract Bond Form	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
Responsible Bidder Information	X	NO	X	X	X	X	X	X
Safety Policy Statement	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
Non Collusion, Anti-Discrimination	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
List of Subcontractors	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
Item 1. Bid Pkg. 101 General (Lead) Contract	\$4,960,000.00	4,792,000.00	5,147,000.00	5,060,000.00	4,897,000.00	4,874,000.00	4,787,000.00	
Alt. 1 (Retractable Awning)		+17,000.00	+17,500.00	+19,000.00	+17,500.00	+16,950.00	+17,000.00	NO bid
Alt. 3 (Transaction Window)		+6,000.00	+4,500.00	+4,500.00	+4,500.00	+4,425.00	+3,000.00	NO bid
Owner Accepted Total								
Item 2. Bid Pkg. 102 Plumbing & F.P. Contract	\$454,000.00	NO Bid	NO Bid	361,000.00	400,000.00	NO Bid	500,000.00	4,114,200.00
Item 3. Bid Pkg. 103 HVAC Contract	\$1,079,000.00		NO Bid	NO Bid	1,050,000.00	NO bid	1,500,000.00	925,000.00
Item 4. Bid Pkg. 104 Electrical Contract	\$1,254,000.00		NO Bid	NO Bid	800,000.00	NO bid	1,300,000.00	NO bid
Alt. 1 (Retractable Awning)					+1,500.00		+17,000.00	NO bid
Owner Accepted Total								
Item 6. Bid Pkg. 101,102,103,104 Combined Bid	\$7,747,000.00	6,798,000.00	NO Bid	(101+102) 5,410,000.00	(101) 7,014,000.00	NO bid	(101) 6,807,000.00	(102+103) 1,303,000.00
Alt. 1 (Retractable Awning)		+17,000		+19,000.00	+19,000.00		+17,000.00	
Alt. 3 (Transaction Window)		+6,000		+4,500.00	+4,500.00		+3,000.00	
Owner Accepted Total								



BID TABULATION SHEET

Project Title: Lorain County Public Health - New Facility

Project No: BPA # 17-38

Bid Date: 10/9/2018

Bid Time: 2:00pm

Bids Opened by: _____

Bids Recorded by: _____

	Company Name Representative Address Phone E-mail	<i>Clare Mechanical</i>	<i>Westland Heating & A/C</i>	<i>JPP MPC Mechanical</i>	<i>Bay Mechanical & Electrical</i>	<i>R.J. Martin Electric</i>	<i>Chemical Corp. of America</i>	<i>Fireland Electric</i>
Addenda (# R01) Acknowledged	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
Bid Form, Properly Signed	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
Bid Guaranty / Contract Bond Form	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
Responsible Bidder Information	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
Safety Policy Statement	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
Non Collusion, Anti-Discrimination	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
List of Subcontractors	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
Item 1. Bid Pkg. 101 General (Lead) Contract	\$4,960,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Alt. 1 (Retractable Awning)		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Alt. 3 (Transaction Window)		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Owner Accepted Total								
Item 2. Bid Pkg. 102 Plumbing & F.P. Contract	\$454,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	367,991.00	473,855.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Item 3. Bid Pkg. 103 HVAC Contract	\$1,079,000.00	1,007,000.00	1,005,000.00	985,166.00	1,067,671.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Item 4. Bid Pkg. 104 Electrical Contract	\$1,254,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	837,447.00	1,013,926.00	1,052,164.00	1,047,873.00	799,000.00
Alt. 1 (Retractable Awning)		No Bid	No Bid	+1,200.00	+1,500.00	+2,705.00	+1,000.00	+1,200.00
Owner Accepted Total								
Item 6. Bid Pkg. 101,102,103,104 Combined Bid	\$7,747,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	102,103+104 2,047,914.00	102,103+104 2,490,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Alt. 1 (Retractable Awning)		No Bid	No Bid	+1,000.00	+1,500.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Alt. 3 (Transaction Window)		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Owner Accepted Total								



BID TABULATION SHEET

Project Title: Lorain County Public Health - New Facility

Project No: BPA # 17-38

Bid Date: 10/9/2018

Bid Time: 2:00pm

Bids Opened by: _____

Bids Recorded by: _____

	Company Name	Representative	Address	Phone	E-mail						
Addenda (# R01) Acknowledged	X										
Bid Form, Properly Signed	X										
Bid Guaranty / Contract Bond Form	X										
Responsible Bidder Information	X										
Safety Policy Statement	X										
Non Collusion, Anti-Discrimination	X										
List of Subcontractors	X										
Item 1. Bid Pkg. 101											
General (Lead) Contract	\$4,960,000.00										
Alt. 1 (Retractable Awning)											
Alt. 3 (Transaction Window)											
Owner Accepted Total											
Item 2. Bid Pkg. 102											
Plumbing & F.P. Contract	\$454,000.00										
Item 3. Bid Pkg. 103											
HVAC Contract	\$1,079,000.00										
Item 4. Bid Pkg. 104											
Electrical Contract	\$1,254,000.00										
Alt. 1 (Retractable Awning)											
Owner Accepted Total											
Item 6. Bid Pkg. 101,102,103,104											
Combined Bid	\$7,747,000.00										
Alt. 1 (Retractable Awning)											
Alt. 3 (Transaction Window)											
Owner Accepted Total											

*Bialosky
Contracting
Group*

NO Bid

NO Bid

NO Bid

NO Bid

*5,050,000.00
+ 170,000.00
+ 6,000.00*

*101
102*