GENERAL CONTRACT WORK Bid Tabulation Due Date: November 29, 2016

Project #1516
LORAIN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Clark & Post Architects, Inc.
6125 South Broadway
Lorain, OH 44053

Lorain County Courthouse
Phase 2 Building Alterations Package
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Brigadier Construction

) No Bid
Service

$3,732,000 $24,900 | $50,100 | $79,200 No Bid $6.25 | $138.00 | $3.50 | $3.50 $6.00 $9.00 | $5.00 | $500 |V |V |V

Cold Harbor Building Co. $3,100,000 $38,500 | $44,750 | $17,500 | $78,000 $6,200,000 $7.25 | $11.50 | $105.00 | $4.25 | $425 | $7.00 | $10.00 | $6.50 | $650 |[v [V |V

Millstone Management $2,986,000 $29,000 $48,720 $19,720 $75,000 No Bid $8.00 $8.00 | $125.00 | $2.45 $6.75 $10.50 $18.00 $4.00 $8.00 |V |V |V

Ozanne Construction $3,200,000 $34,100 | $41,346 | $18,500 | $50,200 $5,124,000 $6.50 | $10.00 | $95.00 | $3.50 | $3.50 | $6.00 | $9.00 | $500 | $500 |V |V |V

SONA Construction $2,797,000 $33,000 | $49,000 | $17,000 | $58,000 No Bid $14.00 | $17.00 | $140.00 | $4.00 | $4.00 | $7.00 | $16.00 | $6.00 | $16.00 |V |V |V
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