COUNTY OF LORAIN BID TABULATION SHEET

Bid for:
Lorain County Consortium for Collection of Solid Waste & Recyclable Materials
Date of Opening: 
Friday, September 6, 2013 at 1:00 PM
	BIDDERS
	Rumpke
	Republic Services

	
	
	

	Solid Waste and Recyclables Collection Service,

5 year term, including provision of a 96 gal. Solid Waste collection container and a 64 gal. Recyclable Materials collection container for each Residential Unit obtaining service

	53.25
	64.38

	Solid Waste and Recyclables Collection Service,

5 year term, including provision of a 64 gal. Solid Waste collection container and a 64 gal. Recyclable Materials collection container for each Residential Unit obtaining service


	47.79
	57.93

	Solid Waste and Recyclables Collection Service,

5 year term, including provision of a 32 gal. Solid Waste collection container and a 64 gal. Recyclable Materials collection container for each Residential Unit obtaining service


	42.90
	52.14

	Non-Collusion Affidavit
	X
	X

	Personal Property Affidavit
	X
	X

	Receipt of Addendum  #1
	X
	X

	Site Location:  Solid Waste Disposal Services 
	Shiloh, OH
	Oberlin, OH

	Site Location:  Recycling Services
	Columbus, OH
	Oberlin, OH


COUNTY OF LORAIN BID TABULATION SHEET

Bid for:
Lorain County Consortium for Collection of Solid Waste & Recyclable Materials

Date of Opening: 
Friday, September 6, 2013 at 1:00 PM

	BIDDERS
	Rumpke
	Republic Services

	
	
	

	Bid Bond - Amherst Township
	X
	X

	Bid Bond - City of Avon Lake
	X
	X

	Bid Bond - Brighton Township
	X
	X

	Bid Bond - Brownhelm Township
	X
	X

	Bid Bond - Eaton Township
	X
	X

	Bid Bond - Elyria Township
	X
	X

	Bid Bond - Grafton Township
	X
	X

	Bid Bond - Huntington Township
	X
	X

	Bid Bond - Penfield Township
	X
	X

	Bid Bond - Pittsfield Township
	X
	X

	Bid Bond - Rochester Township
	X
	X

	Bid Bond - Rochester Village
	X
	X

	Bid Bond - Sheffield Township
	X
	X

	Bid Bond - Sheffield Village
	X
	X

	Per Residential Unit per quarter surcharge for optional carry-out collection service

	NO BID
	21.00


COUNTY OF LORAIN BID TABULATION SHEET

Bid for:
Lorain County Consortium for Collection of Solid Waste & Recyclable Materials

Date of Opening: 
Friday, September 6, 2013 at 1:00 PM

	BIDDERS
	Rumpke
	Republic Services

	
	
	

	Per Residential Unit per quarter surcharge to provide separate Yard Waste Collection Service at the selection of the Residential Unit


	NO BID
	24.00

	Per Residential Unit per quarter surcharge to provide separate Yard Waste Collection Service if every Residential Unit in the Participating Community must receive Yard Waste Collection Service By Resolution or Ordinance


	NO BID
	3.45

	Per Residential Unit per quarter surcharge to provide Unlimited Solid Waste Collection 


	37.86
	24.00

	Per appliance surcharge for chlorofluorocarbon (CFC) removal

	NO BID
	35.00

	Per Residential Unit per quarter surcharge for Residential Unit rental of extra 96 gal. Solid Waste or 64 gal. Recyclable 

Materials Collection Containers

	96 gal. Solid Waste:

$ 16.77
64 gal. Recyclable:

$ 8.73

	96 gal. Solid Waste:

 $ 12.00
64 gal. Recyclable:

$ 7.50


	Cost to provide each open top roll-off container of up to forty (40) yards capacity for a single event 
	NO BID
	375.00


COUNTY OF LORAIN BID TABULATION SHEET

Bid for:
Lorain County Consortium for Collection of Solid Waste & Recyclable Materials

Date of Opening: 
Friday, September 6, 2013 at 1:00 PM

	BIDDERS
	Rumpke
	Republic Services

	
	
	

	Per pull charge for each additional pull of an open top roll-off container of up to forty (40) yards capacity 

	NO BID
	375.00

	Cost to provide each open top roll-off container of up to thirty (30) yards capacity for a single event 


	NO BID
	350.00

	Per pull charge for each additional pull of an open top roll-off container of up to thirty (30) yards capacity 

	NO BID
	350.00

	Cost to provide each dumpster of up to eight (8) yards capacity 


	NO BID
	56.00/lift

	Per pull charge for each additional pull of a dumpster of up to eight (8) yards capacity

	NO BID
	56.00/lift

	Cost to provide each dumpster of up to six (6) yards capacity 


	NO BID
	45.00/lift

	Per pull charge for each additional pull of a dumpster of up to six (6) yards capacity 
	NO BID
	45.00/lift
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